PURCHASING DIVISION
SUMMARY OF BID PROPOSALS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

DATE RECEIVED:
CITY CONTRACT NO.
PROPOSAL NAME:

Tuesday, September 18, 2012, @ 2:00 PM, EDT

13-21

Collection & Disposal of Recycling Materials

NAME, ADDRESS &
BID OF EACH BIDDER

Atlantic County Utilities Authority

Blue Diamond Disposal, Inc.

EarthTech Contracting, Inc.

Waste Management of New Jersey, Inc

P. O. Box 996

P. 0. Box 267

155 Route 50

107 Silvia Street

Pleasantville, NJ 08232-0996

Succasunna, NJ 07876

Seaville, NJ 08230

Ewing, NJ 08628

Richard S. Dovey, President

John Shortino, Jr.

Robert Breunig, President/Owner

Donald Weist, Area Public Sector Mgr.

Ph: (609) 272-6950

Ph: (973) 598-9800

Ph: (609) 390-2127

Ph: (609) 445-6968

Fx: n/a

Fx: (973) 598-9806

Fx: (609) 390-2447

Fx: (609) 567-4484

email: info@acua.com

email: jsbluediamond@yahoo.con]

email: Robert@earthtech.biz

email: Rallen@wm.com

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

FIRST ANNUAL YEAR
COST

FIRST ANNUAL YEAR
COST

FIRST ANNUAL YEAR
COST

FIRST ANNUAL YEAR COST

BASE

BID-SECTION A-CITYWIDE COLLECTION & DISPOSAL OF RECYCLE MATERIAL DUAL STREAM

A-1

Five (5) Year Contract-

Start Date-February 01, 2013
Completion Date - January 31, 2018
Submit Bid Year (1) Once Only

592,000.00

594,000.00

499,844.00

623,092.00

BASE

BID-SECTION A-CITYWIDE COLLECTION & DISPOSAL OF RECYCLE MATERIAL SINGLE STREAM

A-2

Five (5) Year Contract-

Start Date-February 01, 2013
Completion Date - January 31, 2018
Submit Bid Year (1) Once Only

542,000.00

387,000.00

417,000.00

503,092.00

OPTION A-COLLECTION OF RECYCLING MATERIAL -WHITE GOODS & LARGE

TELEVISIONS & MONITORS

A-3

Five (5) Year Contract-Option

Start Date-February 01, 2013
Completion Date - January 31, 2018
Submit Bid Year (1) Once Only

10,000.00

72,000.00

44,737.00

41,912.00

OPTION A-COLLECTION OF RECYCLING MATERIAL -YARD WASTE

A-4

Five (5) Year Contract-Option

Start Date-February 01, 2013
Completion Date - January 31, 2018
Submit Bid Year (1) Once Only

165,000.00

132,000.00

42,877.00

209,616.00

OPTION B-COLLECTION OF RECYCLING MATERIAL-BOARDWALK RECYCLING CANS

Five (5) Year Contract-Option

Start Date-February 01, 2013
Completion Date - January 31, 2018
Submit Bid Year (1) Once Only

no-bid

no -bid

100,000.00

62,964.00

B-2

Extra Boardwalk Collection

Start Date-February 01, 2013
Completion Date - January 31, 2018
Submit Bid Year (1) Once Only

no-bid

no-bid

775.00

1,000.00
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Tuesday, September 18, 2012, @ 2:00 PM, EDT
13-21
Collection & Disposal of Recycling Materials

NAME, ADDRESS & Atlantic County Utilities Authority |Blue Diamond Disposal, Inc. EarthTech Contracting, Inc. Waste Management of New Jersey, Inc
BID OF EACH BIDDER P. O. Box 996 P. O. Box 267 155 Route 50 107 Silvia Street
Pleasantville, NJ 08232-0996 Succasunna, NJ 07876 Seaville, NJ 08230 Ewing, NJ 08628
Richard S. Dovey, President John Shortino, Jr. Robert Breunig, President/Owner |Donald Weist, Area Public Sector Mgr.
Ph: (609) 272-6950 Ph: (973) 598-9800 Ph: (609) 390-2127 Ph: (609) 445-6968
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email: info@acua.com email: jsbluediamond@yahoo.comjemail: Robert@earthtech.biz email: Rallen@wm.com
FIRST ANNUAL YEAR FIRST ANNUAL YEAR FIRST ANNUAL YEAR
ITEM DESCRIPTION COST COST COST FIRST ANNUAL YEAR COST
OPTION C-COLLECTION OF RECYCLING MATERIAL-BUSINESS DISTRICT RECYCLING CANS
Five (5) Year Contract Option
Start Date-February 01, 2013
Completion Date - January 31, 2018
Cost per Collection
C-1|Submit Bid Year (1) Once Only no-bid no-bid $ 30,141.00 $ 11,040.00
Extra Downtown Collection
Start Date-February 01, 2013
Completion Date - January 31, 2018
C-2|Submit Bid Year (1) Once Only no-bid no-bid $ 615.00 $ 400.00
OPTION D-COLLECTION OF RECYCLING MATERIAL-STREET END RECYCLING CANS
Five (5) Year Contract Option
Start Date-February 01, 2013
Completion Date - January 31, 2018
Cost per Collection
D-1|Submit Bid Year (1) Once Only no-bid no-bid $ 127,733.00 $ 154,344.00
Extra Street End Collection
Start Date-February 01, 2013
Completion Date - January 31, 2018
D-2|Submit Bid Year (1) Once Only no-bid no-bid $ 1,100.00 $ 1,500.00
Required Contract Information
BID BOND/SECURITY:} YES/NO Proposed Shared Service YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
CERTIFICATE OF SURETY:] YES/NO Agreement YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
RIGHT TO EXTEND-ITEM FOR AWARD:] YES/NO n/a YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE STATEMENT:] YES/NO n/a YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT:] YES/NO n/a YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
NJ MANDATORY EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY LANGUAGE :] YES/NO n/a YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
AFFIRMATIVE ACTION REGULATION COMPLIANT:] YES/NO n/a YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF RECEIPT OF ADDENDA:] YES/NO n/a YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE SUBMITTED:] YES/NO n/a YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
REFERENCES:] YES/NO n/a YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
NUMBER OF COPIES PROVIDED (2): 2 2 2 2










