
PURCHASING DIVISION DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, September 18, 2012, @ 2:00 PM, EDT
SUMMARY OF BID PROPOSALS CITY CONTRACT NO. 13-20

PROPOSAL NAME: Collection & Disposal Service for Recycling Material & 
BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ Solid Waste Containers

NAME, ADDRESS & Blue Diamond Disposal, Inc. EarthTech Contracting, Inc. Waste Management of New Jersey, Inc.
BID OF EACH BIDDER P. O. Box 267 155 Route 50 107 Silvia Street

Succasunna, NJ 07876 Seaville, NJ  08230 Ewing, NJ  08628

John Shortino, Jr., President Robert Breunig, President/Owner Donald Weist, Area Public  Sector Mgr.

Ph:  (973) 598-9800 Ph:  (609) 390-2127 Ph:  (609) 567-2398
Fx:  (973) 598-9806 Fx:  (609) 390-2447 Fx:  (609) 567-4484
email:  jsbluediamond@yahoo.com email:  robert@earthtech.biz email:  rallen@wm.com

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
FIRST ANNUAL YEAR 

COST
FIRST ANNUAL YEAR 

COST FIRST ANNUAL YEAR COST
FIRST ANNUAL YEAR 

COST
FURNISHING & SERVICE OF TWO (2) CUBIC YARD TRASH CONTAINERS FOR THE OCEAN CITY 
MUNICIPAL OPERATIONS

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                

1A
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     
Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER PULL 11.85$                              10.90$                              12.00$                                      -$                                  

FURNISHING & SERVICE OF TWO (2) CUBIC YARD RECYCLING CONTAINERS FOR THE OCEAN CITY 
MUNICIPAL OPERATIONS LOCATED AT THE OCEAN CITY COMMUNITY CENTER

1B

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     
Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER PULL 8.00$                                8.90$                                12.00$                                      -$                                  

FURNISHING & SERVICE OF THREE (3) CUBIC YARD CONTAINERS FOR THE OCEAN CITY 
MUNICIPAL OPERATIONS LOCATED AT THE OCEAN CITY COMMUNITY CENTER

1C

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     
Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER PULL 17.85$                              16.50$                              15.00$                                      -$                                  

FURNISHING & SERVICE OF FOUR (4) CUBIC YARD  CONTAINERS FOR THE OCEAN CITY 
MUNICIPAL OPERATIONS LOCATED AT THE OCEAN CITY COMMUNITY CENTER

1D

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     
Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER PULL 23.80$                              22.00$                              no -bid -$                                  

EMPTYING & DISPOSAL OF SEVEN (7) CUBIC YARD MUNICIPAL BEACH TRASH CONTAINERS LOCATED
AT SHELTER ROAD

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     
S b it Bid f Y (1) O l $ $ b d $2A Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER PULL 140.00$                            210.00$                            no-bid -$                                  

FURNISHING OF TWENTY (20) CUBIC YARD CONTAINERS FOR THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY MUNICIPAL
OPERATIONS SPECIAL EVENTS

3A

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     
Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER PULL 134.00$                             129.00$                             155.00$                                     -$                                  



PURCHASING DIVISION DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, September 18, 2012, @ 2:00 PM, EDT
SUMMARY OF BID PROPOSALS CITY CONTRACT NO. 13-20

PROPOSAL NAME: Collection & Disposal Service for Recycling Material & 
BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ Solid Waste Containers

NAME, ADDRESS & Blue Diamond Disposal, Inc. EarthTech Contracting, Inc. Waste Management of New Jersey, Inc.
BID OF EACH BIDDER P. O. Box 267 155 Route 50 107 Silvia Street

Succasunna, NJ 07876 Seaville, NJ  08230 Ewing, NJ  08628

John Shortino, Jr., President Robert Breunig, President/Owner Donald Weist, Area Public  Sector Mgr.

Ph:  (973) 598-9800 Ph:  (609) 390-2127 Ph:  (609) 567-2398
Fx:  (973) 598-9806 Fx:  (609) 390-2447 Fx:  (609) 567-4484
email:  jsbluediamond@yahoo.com email:  robert@earthtech.biz email:  rallen@wm.com

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
FIRST ANNUAL YEAR 

COST
FIRST ANNUAL YEAR 

COST FIRST ANNUAL YEAR COST
FIRST ANNUAL YEAR 

COST
FURNISHING OF THIRTY (30) CUBIC YARD CONTAINERS FOR THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY MUNICIPAL
OPERATIONS SPECIAL EVENTS

3B

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     
Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER PULL 134.00$                             129.00$                             155.00$                                     -$                                  

FURNISHING OF FORTY (40) CUBIC YARD CONTAINERS FOR THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY MUNICIPAL
OPERATIONS SPECIAL EVENTS

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01 2013

3C

Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     
Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER PULL 134.00$                             129.00$                             175.00$                                     -$                                  

FURNISHING OF THREE (3)  CUBIC YARD CONTAINERS FOR THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY MUNICIPAL
OPERATIONS SPECIAL EVENTS

4A

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     
Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER PULL 17.85$                              27.00$                              15.00$                                      -$                                  

FURNISHING OF FOUR (4)  CUBIC YARD CONTAINERS FOR THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY MUNICIPAL
OPERATIONS SPECIAL EVENTS

4B

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     
Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER PULL 23.80$                              36.00$                              no-bid -$                                  

FURNISHING OF FIVE (5)  CUBIC YARD CONTAINERS FOR THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY MUNICIPAL
OPERATIONS SPECIAL EVENTS

4C

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     
Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER PULL 29.70$                              45.00$                              no-bid -$                                  

FURNISHING OF SIX (6)  CUBIC YARD CONTAINERS FOR THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY MUNICIPAL
OPERATIONS SPECIAL EVENTS

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     

4D
p y ,

Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER PULL 35.70$                              54.00$                              no-bid -$                                  



PURCHASING DIVISION DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, September 18, 2012, @ 2:00 PM, EDT
SUMMARY OF BID PROPOSALS CITY CONTRACT NO. 13-20

PROPOSAL NAME: Collection & Disposal Service for Recycling Material & 
BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ Solid Waste Containers

NAME, ADDRESS & Blue Diamond Disposal, Inc. EarthTech Contracting, Inc. Waste Management of New Jersey, Inc.
BID OF EACH BIDDER P. O. Box 267 155 Route 50 107 Silvia Street

Succasunna, NJ 07876 Seaville, NJ  08230 Ewing, NJ  08628

John Shortino, Jr., President Robert Breunig, President/Owner Donald Weist, Area Public  Sector Mgr.

Ph:  (973) 598-9800 Ph:  (609) 390-2127 Ph:  (609) 567-2398
Fx:  (973) 598-9806 Fx:  (609) 390-2447 Fx:  (609) 567-4484
email:  jsbluediamond@yahoo.com email:  robert@earthtech.biz email:  rallen@wm.com

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
FIRST ANNUAL YEAR 

COST
FIRST ANNUAL YEAR 

COST FIRST ANNUAL YEAR COST
FIRST ANNUAL YEAR 

COST
FURNISHING OF EIGHT (8)  CUBIC YARD CONTAINERS FOR THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY MUNICIPAL
OPERATIONS SPECIAL EVENTS

4E

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     
Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER PULL 47.60$                              72.00$                              no-bid -$                                  

FURNISHING OF SOLID WASTE COLLECTION VEHICLES FOR THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY MUNICIPAL 
OPERATIONS & SPECIAL EVENTS DESCRIPTION OF VEHICLE-ONE (1) SOLID WASTE OR RECYCLING
VEHICLE WITH QUALIFIED DRIVER-PER DAY RATE

Five (5) Year Contract Option

5A

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     
Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER DAY 1,150.00$                          1,200.00$                          1,200.00$                                  -$                                  

FURNISHING OF SOLID WASTE COLLECTION VEHICLES FOR THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY MUNICIPAL 
OPERATIONS & SPECIAL EVENTS DESCRIPTION OF VEHICLE-ONE (1) SOLID WASTE OR RECYCLING
VEHICLE WITH QUALIFIED DRIVER & TWO (2) LABORERS PER HOUR RATE

5B

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     
Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER HOUR 150.00$                             180.00$                             150.00$                                     -$                                  

FURNISHING OF SOLID WASTE COLLECTION VEHICLES FOR THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY MUNICIPAL 
OPERATIONS & SPECIAL EVENTS DESCRIPTION OF VEHICLE-ONE (1) SOLID WASTE OR RECYCLING
VEHICLE WITH QUALIFIED DRIVER & TWO (2) LABORERS PER DAY RATE

5C

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     
Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER DAY 1,200.00$                          1,800.00$                          1,500.00$                                  -$                                  

FURNISH, TRANSPORT & DISPOSAL OF TEN (10) CUBIC YARD MUNICIPAL CONTAINERS FOR THE 
CITY OF OCEAN CITY SHELTER ROAD RECYCLING CENTER OPERATIONS

6A

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     
Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER PULL 134.00$                             129.00$                             155.00$                                     -$                                  



PURCHASING DIVISION DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, September 18, 2012, @ 2:00 PM, EDT
SUMMARY OF BID PROPOSALS CITY CONTRACT NO. 13-20

PROPOSAL NAME: Collection & Disposal Service for Recycling Material & 
BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ Solid Waste Containers

NAME, ADDRESS & Blue Diamond Disposal, Inc. EarthTech Contracting, Inc. Waste Management of New Jersey, Inc.
BID OF EACH BIDDER P. O. Box 267 155 Route 50 107 Silvia Street

Succasunna, NJ 07876 Seaville, NJ  08230 Ewing, NJ  08628

John Shortino, Jr., President Robert Breunig, President/Owner Donald Weist, Area Public  Sector Mgr.

Ph:  (973) 598-9800 Ph:  (609) 390-2127 Ph:  (609) 567-2398
Fx:  (973) 598-9806 Fx:  (609) 390-2447 Fx:  (609) 567-4484
email:  jsbluediamond@yahoo.com email:  robert@earthtech.biz email:  rallen@wm.com

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
FIRST ANNUAL YEAR 

COST
FIRST ANNUAL YEAR 

COST FIRST ANNUAL YEAR COST
FIRST ANNUAL YEAR 

COST
FURNISH, TRANSPORT & DISPOSAL OF FIFTEEN (15)  CUBIC YARD MUNICIPAL CONTAINERS FOR THE 
CITY OF OCEAN CITY SHELTER ROAD RECYCLING CENTER OPERATIONS

6B

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     
Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER PULL 134.00$                             129.00$                             155.00$                                     -$                                  

FURNISH, TRANSPORT & DISPOSAL OF TWENTY (20)  CUBIC YARD MUNICIPAL CONTAINERS FOR THE 
CITY OF OCEAN CITY SHELTER ROAD RECYCLING CENTER OPERATIONS

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013

6C

Start Date February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     
Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER PULL 134.00$                             129.00$                             155.00$                                     -$                                  

FURNISH, TRANSPORT & DISPOSAL OF THIRTY (30)  CUBIC YARD MUNICIPAL CONTAINERS FOR THE 
CITY OF OCEAN CITY SHELTER ROAD RECYCLING CENTER OPERATIONS

6D

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     
Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER PULL 134.00$                             129.00$                             155.00$                                     -$                                  

FURNISH, TRANSPORT & DISPOSAL OF THIRTY (30)  CUBIC YARD COMPACTOR FOR THE CITY
OF OCEAN CITY SHELTER ROAD RECYCLING CENTER OPERATIONS

6E

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     
Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER PULL 134.00$                             250.00$                             225.00$                                     -$                                  

FURNISH, TRANSPORT & DISPOSAL OF FORTY (40)  CUBIC YARD MUNICIPAL CONTAINERS FOR THE 
CITY OF OCEAN CITY SHELTER ROAD RECYCLING CENTER OPERATIONS

6F

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     
Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER PULL 141.00$                             139.00$                             175.00$                                     -$                                  

FURNISH, TRANSPORT & DISPOSAL OF TEN (10)  CUBIC YARD MUNICIPAL CONTAINERS FOR THE CITY
OF OCEAN CITY SHELTER ROAD RECYCLING CENTER OPERATIONS

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     

6G
p y ,

Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER PULL 134.00$                             129.00$                             155.00$                                     -$                                  



PURCHASING DIVISION DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, September 18, 2012, @ 2:00 PM, EDT
SUMMARY OF BID PROPOSALS CITY CONTRACT NO. 13-20

PROPOSAL NAME: Collection & Disposal Service for Recycling Material & 
BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ Solid Waste Containers

NAME, ADDRESS & Blue Diamond Disposal, Inc. EarthTech Contracting, Inc. Waste Management of New Jersey, Inc.
BID OF EACH BIDDER P. O. Box 267 155 Route 50 107 Silvia Street

Succasunna, NJ 07876 Seaville, NJ  08230 Ewing, NJ  08628

John Shortino, Jr., President Robert Breunig, President/Owner Donald Weist, Area Public  Sector Mgr.

Ph:  (973) 598-9800 Ph:  (609) 390-2127 Ph:  (609) 567-2398
Fx:  (973) 598-9806 Fx:  (609) 390-2447 Fx:  (609) 567-4484
email:  jsbluediamond@yahoo.com email:  robert@earthtech.biz email:  rallen@wm.com

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
FIRST ANNUAL YEAR 

COST
FIRST ANNUAL YEAR 

COST FIRST ANNUAL YEAR COST
FIRST ANNUAL YEAR 

COST
FURNISH, TRANSPORT & DISPOSAL OF FIFTEEN (15)  CUBIC YARD MUNICIPAL CONTAINERS FOR THE 
CITY OF OCEAN CITY SHELTER ROAD RECYCLING CENTER OPERATIONS

6H

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     
Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER PULL 134.00$                             129.00$                             155.00$                                     -$                                  

 TRANSPORT & DISPOSAL OF TWENTY (20)  CUBIC YARD MUNICIPAL CONTAINERS FOR THE 
CITY OF OCEAN CITY SHELTER ROAD RECYCLING CENTER OPERATIONS

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013

6I

Start Date February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     
Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER PULL 134.00$                             129.00$                             155.00$                                     -$                                  

TRANSPORT & DISPOSAL OF THIRTY (30) CUBIC YARD COMPACTOR FOR THE CITY
OF OCEAN CITY SHELTER ROAD RECYCLING CENTER OPERATIONS

6J

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     
Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER PULL 134.00$                             140.00$                             190.00$                                     -$                                  

TRANSPORT & DISPOSAL OF FORTY (40)  CUBIC YARD MUNICIPAL CONTAINERS FOR THE 
CITY OF OCEAN CITY SHELTER ROAD RECYCLING CENTER OPERATIONS

6K

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     
Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER PULL 141.00$                             139.00$                             175.00$                                     -$                                  

FURNISH & SERVICE TWO (2) CUBIC YARD TRASH CONTAINERS FOR THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY 
BOARD OF EDUCATION

7A

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     
Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER PULL 11.85$                              10.90$                              12.00$                                      -$                                  

SERVICE OF TWENTY (20) CUBIC YARD TRASH COMPACTOR FOR THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY 
BOARD OF EDUCATION

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     

7B
p y ,

Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER PULL 134.00$                             500.00$                             425.00$                                     -$                                  



PURCHASING DIVISION DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, September 18, 2012, @ 2:00 PM, EDT
SUMMARY OF BID PROPOSALS CITY CONTRACT NO. 13-20

PROPOSAL NAME: Collection & Disposal Service for Recycling Material & 
BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ Solid Waste Containers

NAME, ADDRESS & Blue Diamond Disposal, Inc. EarthTech Contracting, Inc. Waste Management of New Jersey, Inc.
BID OF EACH BIDDER P. O. Box 267 155 Route 50 107 Silvia Street

Succasunna, NJ 07876 Seaville, NJ  08230 Ewing, NJ  08628

John Shortino, Jr., President Robert Breunig, President/Owner Donald Weist, Area Public  Sector Mgr.

Ph:  (973) 598-9800 Ph:  (609) 390-2127 Ph:  (609) 567-2398
Fx:  (973) 598-9806 Fx:  (609) 390-2447 Fx:  (609) 567-4484
email:  jsbluediamond@yahoo.com email:  robert@earthtech.biz email:  rallen@wm.com

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
FIRST ANNUAL YEAR 

COST
FIRST ANNUAL YEAR 

COST FIRST ANNUAL YEAR COST
FIRST ANNUAL YEAR 

COST
FURNISH & SERVICE TWO (2) CUBIC YARD RECYCLE CONTAINERS FOR THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY 
BOARD OF EDUCATION

7C

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     
Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER PULL 8.00$                                10.90$                              10.00$                                      -$                                  

FURNISH & SERVICE FOUR (4) CUBIC YARD RECYCLE CONTAINERS FOR THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY 
BOARD OF EDUCATION

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01 2013

7D

Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     
Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER PULL 9.00$                                21.90$                              10.00$                                      -$                                  

FURNISH & SERVICE NINETY-EIGHT (98) GALLON RECYCLE CONTAINERS FOR THE CITY OF OCEAN
CITY BOARD OF EDUCATION

7E

Five (5) Year Contract Option                                                
Start Date-February 01, 2013                                                
Completion Date - January 31, 2018                                     
Submit Bid for Year (1) Only                                                  COST PER PULL 5.75$                                7.00$                                10.00$                                      -$                                  

Required Contract Information
BID BOND/SECURITY: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO

CERTIFICATE OF SURETY: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO
RIGHT TO EXTEND-ITEM FOR AWARD: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE STATEMENT: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO

NJ MANDATORY EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY LANGUAGE : YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO
AFFIRMATIVE ACTION REGULATION COMPLIANT: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF RECEIPT OF ADDENDA (1): YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO
BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE SUBMITTED: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO

REFERENCES: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO

NUMBER OF COPIES PROVIDED (2): 2 2 2


