PURCHASING DIVISION
SUMMARY OF BID PROPOSALS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

DATE RECEIVED:
CITY CONTRACT NO.
PROPOSAL NAME:

Tuesday, August 21, 2012 @ 2:00 PM EDT

13-19

Municipal Solid Waste Collection Services

NAME, ADDRESS &
BID OF EACH BIDDER

Advant-Edge Solutions of

Atlantic County Utilities Authority

Blue Diamond Disposal Inc.

Earthtech Contracting, Inc.

Waste Management of

Mid Atlantic, Inc.

P. O. Box 996

P. O. Box 267

155 Rt. 50

New Jersey Inc.

1 Shea Way

Pleasantivlle, NJ 08232-0996

Succasunna, NJ 07876

Seaville, NJ 08230

107 Silvia Street

Newark, DE 19713

Ewing, NJ_08628

Laurie B. Holland, Vice President

Richard S. Dovey, President

John Shortino, Jr., President

Robert Breunig, President/Owner

Jeffrey Bryk, Area Manager

Ph: (302) 533-6858

Ph: (609) 272-6950

Ph: (973) 598-9800

Ph: (609) 390-2127

Ph:_(800) 633-9096

Fx: (800) 417-8225

Fx: n/a

Fx: (973) 598-9806

Fx: (609) 390-2447

Fx: (609) 434-5764

email: sales@asiwaste.com

email: info@acua.com

email:_jsbluediamond@yahoo.com

email: robert@earthtech.biz

email:_jbryk@wm.com

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

FIRST ANNUAL YEAR
COST

FIRST ANNUAL YEAR
COST

FIRST ANNUAL YEAR
COST

FIRST ANNUAL YEAR
COST

FIRST ANNUAL YEAR
COST

BASE

BID-Citywide Collection of Municipal Solid Waste, Existing Mixed Routes

A-1

Five (5) Year Contract-

Start Date-February 01, 2013
Completion Date - January 31, 2018
Submit Bid Year (1) Once Only

$ 1,078,567.09

no bid

$ 822,000.00

$ 949,500.00

$ 854,268.00

OPTION #1-Collection of Boardwalk Trash Containers

B-1

Five (5) Year Contract-Option

Start Date-February 01, 2013
Completion Date - January 31, 2018
Submit Bid Year (1) Once Only

$ 1,078,567.09

no bid

no bid

$ 185,000.00

$ 235,044.00

B-2

Extra Boardwalk Collection-

Start Date-February 01, 2013
Completion Date - January 31, 2018
Submit Bid Year (1) Once Only

no bid
(per collection/year)

no bid
(per collection/year)

no bid
(per collection/year)

$ 1,500.00
(per collection/year)

$ 720.00
(per collection/year)

OPTION #2-Collection of Business District Trash Containers

C-1

Five (5) Year Contract-Option

Start Date-February 01, 2013
Completion Date - January 31, 2018
Submit Bid Year (1) Once Only

$ 1,078,567.09

no bid

no bid

$ 43,600.00

$ 29,724.00

Cc-2

Extra Collection of the Business Downtown Trash
Containers

Start Date-February 01, 2013

Completion Date - January 31, 2018

Submit Bid Year (1) Once Only

no bid
(per collection/year)

no bid
(per collection/year)

no bid
(per collection/year)

$ 750.00
(per collection/year)

$ 138.00
(per collection/year)




PURCHASING DIVISION
SUMMARY OF BID PROPOSALS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

DATE RECEIVED:
CITY CONTRACT NO.
PROPOSAL NAME:

Tuesday, August 21, 2012 @ 2:00 PM EDT

13-19

Municipal Solid Waste Collection Services

NAME, ADDRESS &
BID OF EACH BIDDER

Advant-Edge Solutions of

Atlantic County Utilities Authority

Blue Diamond Disposal Inc.

Earthtech Contracting, Inc.

Waste Management of

Mid Atlantic, Inc.

P. O. Box 996

P. O. Box 267

155 Rt. 50

New Jersey Inc.

1 Shea Way

Pleasantivlle, NJ 08232-0996

Succasunna, NJ 07876

Seaville, NJ 08230

107 Silvia Street

Newark, DE 19713

Ewing, NJ_08628

Laurie B. Holland, Vice President

Richard S. Dovey, President

John Shortino, Jr., President

Robert Breunig, President/Owner

Jeffrey Bryk, Area Manager

Ph: (302) 533-6858

Ph: (609) 272-6950

Ph: (973) 598-9800

Ph: (609) 390-2127

Ph:_(800) 633-9096

Fx: (800) 417-8225

Fx: n/a

Fx: (973) 598-9806

Fx: (609) 390-2447

Fx: (609) 434-5764

email: sales@asiwaste.com

email: info@acua.com

email:_jsbluediamond@yahoo.com

email: robert@earthtech.biz

email:_jbryk@wm.com

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

FIRST ANNUAL YEAR
COST

FIRST ANNUAL YEAR
COST

FIRST ANNUAL YEAR
COST

FIRST ANNUAL YEAR
COST

FIRST ANNUAL YEAR
COST

OPTION #3-Collection of Street End Trash Containers

Five (5) Year Contract-

Start Date-February 01, 2013
Completion Date - January 31, 2018
Submit Bid Year (1) Once Only

$ 1,078,567.09

no bid

no bid

$ 115,500.00

$ 75,540.00

Extra Street End Collection Trash Containers
Start Date-February 01, 2013

Completion Date - January 31, 2018

Submit Bid Year (1) Once Only

no bid
(per collection/year)

no bid
(per collection/year)

no bid
(per collection/year)

$ 1,000.00
(per collection/year)

$ 431.00
(per collection/year)

Required Contract Information

BID BOND/SECURITY:}] YES/NO Y YES/NO N YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

CERTIFICATE OF SURETY:] YES/NO Y YES/NO N YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

RIGHT TO EXTEND-ITEM FOR AWARD:] YES/NO Y YES/NO N YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE STATEMENT:} YES/NO Y YES/NO N YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT:] YES/NO Y YES/NO N YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

NJ MANDATORY EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY ] YES/NO Y YES/NO N YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
AFFIRMATIVE ACTION REGULATION COMPLAIN:} YES/NO Y YES/NO N YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF RECEIPT OF ADDENDA (1):}] YES/NO Y YES/NO N YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE SUBMITTED:] YES/NO N YES/NO N YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
STATEMENT OF BIDDER'S QUALIFICATION , EXPERIENCE & FINANCIAL ABILITY AFFIDAVIT:] YES/NO Y YES/NO N YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
QUESTIONNAIRE:] YES/NO Y YES/NO N YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

REFERENCES:] YES/NO Y YES/NO N YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

NUMBER OF COPIES PROVIDED (2): 2 2 2 2




