PURCHASING DIVISION
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, January 8, 2013 @ 2:00 PM, EST
CITY CONTRACT #: 13-04
PROPOSAL NAME: Printing Services for the City of Ocean City

NAME, ADDRESS AND
BID OF EACH BIDDER

AK Printing Inc.

Allegra #387 (DBA)

Copiers Plus, Inc.

Del Val Print Solutions

Express Press (DBA)

GraphiColor Corporation

Howe's Standard Publishing

191 Throckmorton Street

SJ Shore Marketing, LLC

3112 Fire Road

27 Chestertown Road

Allegro Printing Corporation

3490 North Mill Road

1980 South West Boulevard

Freehold, NJ 07728

510 South Shore Road

Egg Harbor Township, NJ 08234

Erial, NJ 08081

623 Tilton Road

Vineland, NJ 08360

Vineland, NJ 08360

Marmora, NJ 08223

Northfield, NJ 08225

Adam Kleinwaks, President

Nicholas J. Wieand, Owner/Operator

Robert P. Matthews, President

[Joseph Hughes, Jr.

Richard H. Lamkin, President

Robert W. Stenger, Jr., President

Barry Opromollo, President

Ph: (723) 333-0031

Ph: (609) 390-1400

Ph: (609) 645-7587

Ph: (856) 344-2249

Ph: (609) 641-7060

Ph: (856) 691-2507

Ph: (856) 691-2000

Fx: (732) 333-0064

Fx: (609) 390-0217

Fx: (609) 645-1535

Fx: n/a

Fx: (609) 383-0340

Fx: (856-696-3229

Fx: (856-692-4399

email: akprinting@comcast.net

email: nickw@allegramarmora.com

email: info@copiersplus.com

email: dvprint@comcast.net

email: expresspress@comcast.net]

email: graphemail@aol.com

email: barry@standard-publishing.com

ITEM | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
IGROUP 1.0 -COMMUNITY SERVICES
1A AQUATIC & FITNESS CENTER
1]Instruction/Participation Waiver 25 M 202.50 202.50 180.00 180.00 540.00 540.00 155.00 155.00 66.00 165.00 190.00 475.00 65.20 163.00
2|Waiver 50 C 86.00 86.00 95.00 95.00 195.00 195.00 72.00 72.00 70.00 70.00 400.00 400.00 71.00 71.00
1 ™M 132.50 132.50 120.00 120.00 345.00 345.00 93.00 93.00 90.00 90.00 430.00 430.00 91.00 91.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 1A $ 421.00 $ 395.00 $ 1,080.00 $ 320.00 $ 325.00 $ 1,305.00 $ 325.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 1A 3 2 3 2 2 3 3
1B BEACH WALK/BAYSIDE CENTER/OC MARINA/SHADE TREE
1|Beach Walk Flyer 1 M 112.50 112.50 60.00 60.00 59.00 59.00 45.00 45.00 40.00 40.00 275.00 275.00 95.00 95.00
2|Beach Walk Poster (2 color) 50 EACH 70.00 70.00 22.00 22.00 19.00 19.00 21.00 21.00 20.00 20.00 175.00 175.00 21.00 21.00
10 C 105.00 105.00 40.00 40.00 37.00 37.00 30.00 30.00 35.00 35.00 230.00 230.00 38.00 38.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 1B $ 287.50 $ 122.00 $ 115.00 $ 96.00 $ 95.00 $ 680.00 $ 154.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 1B 3 2 3 2 2 3 3
1C RECREATION DIVISION
1|Recreations Programs Voucher 1 M 165.00 165.00 150.00 150.00 349.00 349.00 125.00 125.00 150.00 150.00 395.00 395.00 153.00 153.00
2|Tennis Discount Cards 2 C 120.00 120.00 35.00 35.00 59.00 59.00 35.00 35.00 32.00 32.00 175.00 175.00 35.00 35.00
3|Daily Record of Tennis Courts 2 C 414.00 414.00 225.00 225.00 275.00 275.00 101.00 101.00 225.00 225.00 275.00 275.00 115.00 115.00
4|Tennis Court Daily Log 1 M 105.00 105.00 110.00 110.00 295.00 295.00 92.00 92.00 105.00 105.00 340.00 340.00 96.00 96.00
5|Tennis Court Daily Transmittal Sheet 5 C 95.00 95.00 85.00 85.00 200.00 200.00 87.00 87.00 85.00 85.00 305.00 305.00 80.00 80.00
6|Basketball League Sign-up Form 5 C 95.00 95.00 85.00 85.00 200.00 200.00 87.00 87.00 85.00 85.00 235.00 235.00 80.00 80.00
7|Surf Chair Participant Information Form 5 C 68.00 68.00 75.00 75.00 165.00 165.00 73.00 73.00 75.00 75.00 245.00 245.00 79.00 79.00
8|Surf Chair Donation Form 5 C 68.00 68.00 75.00 75.00 165.00 165.00 73.00 73.00 75.00 75.00 245.00 245.00 79.00 79.00
9|Surf Chair Program Brochure 2 C 78.00 78.00 75.00 75.00 195.00 195.00 64.00 64.00 65.00 65.00 270.00 270.00 65.00 65.00
5 C 128.00 128.00 90.00 90.00 425.00 425.00 85.00 85.00 90.00 90.00 295.00 295.00 90.00 90.00
10|Beach walk Revenue Form 5 C 59.00 59.00 80.00 80.00 135.00 135.00 75.00 75.00 55.00 55.00 305.00 305.00 71.00 71.00
11|Music Pier Pops & Special Revenue Form 5 C 43.00 43.00 50.00 50.00 165.00 165.00 52.00 52.00 75.00 75.00 160.00 160.00 81.00 81.00
12|Little Miss Ocean City Booklet 4 C 380.00 380.00 1,650.00 1,650.00 1,100.00 1,100.00 210.00 210.00 1,450.00 1,450.00 925.00 925.00 1,650.00 1,650.00
13|Junior Miss Ocean City Booklet 3 C 365.00 365.00 1,350.00 1,350.00 1,000.00 1,000.00 205.00 205.00 1,754.00 1,754.00 870.00 870.00 1,570.00 1,570.00
14|Race Day Registration Application 2 C 103.00 103.00 50.00 50.00 89.00 89.00 53.00 53.00 50.00 50.00 - - 51.00 51.00
15|Ocean City Municipal Golf Course Bag Tags 5 C - - 190.00 190.00 - - - - 260.00 260.00 - - 285.00 285.00
16]Ocean City Baby Parade Entry Blank 250 EACH 31.50 31.50 60.00 60.00 75.00 75.00 47.00 47.00 50.00 50.00 - - 45.00 45.00
1 C 28.00 28.00 40.00 40.00 245.00 245.00 24.00 24.00 40.00 40.00 - - 40.00 40.00
50 EACH 23.00 23.00 25.00 25.00 19.00 19.00 19.00 19.00 35.00 35.00 - - 35.00 35.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 1C $ 2,368.50 $ 4,500.00 $ 5,156.00 $ 1,507.00 $ 4,756.00 $ 5,040.00 $ 4,700.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 1C 18 16 18 15 16 14 19




PURCHASING DIVISION
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, January 8, 2013 @ 2:00 PM, EST
CITY CONTRACT #: 13-04
PROPOSAL NAME: Printing Services for the City of Ocean City

NAME, ADDRESS AND
BID OF EACH BIDDER

AK Printing Inc.

Allegra #387 (DBA)

Copiers Plus, Inc.

Del Val Print Solutions

Express Press (DBA)

GraphiColor Corporation

Howe's Standard Publishing

191 Throckmorton Street

SJ Shore Marketing, LLC

3112 Fire Road

27 Chestertown Road

Allegro Printing Corporation

3490 North Mill Road

1980 South West Boulevard

Freehold, NJ 07728

510 South Shore Road

Egg Harbor Township, NJ 08234

Erial, NJ 08081

623 Tilton Road

Vineland, NJ 08360

Vineland, NJ 08360

Marmora, NJ 08223

Northfield, NJ 08225

Adam Kleinwaks, President

Nicholas J. Wieand, Owner/Operator

Robert P. Matthews, President

[Joseph Hughes, Jr.

Richard H. Lamkin, President

Robert W. Stenger, Jr., President

Barry Opromollo, President

Ph: (723) 333-0031

Ph: (609) 390-1400

Ph: (609) 645-7587

Ph: (856) 344-2249

Ph: (609) 641-7060

Ph: (856) 691-2507

Ph: (856) 691-2000

Fx: (732) 333-0064

Fx: (609) 390-0217

Fx: (609) 645-1535

Fx: n/a

Fx: (609) 383-0340

Fx: (856-696-3229

Fx: (856-692-4399

email: akprinting@comcast.net

email: nickw@allegramarmora.com

email: info@copiersplus.com

email: dvprint@comcast.net

email: expresspress@comcast.net]

email: graphemail@aol.com

email: barry@standard-publishing.com

ITEM | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
1D MUNICIPAL CODE DIVISION
1|Solid Waste Enforcement Door Knob Notice 5 C 65.00 65.00 60.00 60.00 135.00 135.00 60.00 60.00 60.00 60.00 - - 60.00 60.00
1 M 113.00 113.00 85.00 85.00 260.00 260.00 80.00 80.00 85.00 85.00 - - 85.00 85.00
2|Notice-Street/Alley Construction Door Knob Notice 1 M 113.00 113.00 105.00 105.00 290.00 290.00 79.00 79.00 100.00 100.00 - - 110.00 110.00
3|Street Opening Permit 5 C 175.00 175.00 135.00 135.00 195.00 195.00 107.00 107.00 120.00 120.00 - - 122.00 122.00
1 M 319.00 319.00 225.00 225.00 375.00 375.00 177.00 177.00 190.00 190.00 - - 220.00 220.00
4|Notice. Smoke Detector Inspection Door Knob Card 5 C 90.00 90.00 55.00 55.00 175.00 175.00 55.00 55.00 50.00 50.00 - - 52.00 52.00
1 M 138.00 138.00 90.00 90.00 325.00 325.00 85.00 85.00 87.00 87.00 - - 90.00 90.00
5|Zoning Permit Application 5 C 150.00 150.00 135.00 135.00 250.00 250.00 117.00 117.00 127.00 127.00 395.00 395.00 132.00 132.00
1 ™M 256.00 256.00 205.00 205.00 480.00 480.00 183.00 183.00 200.00 200.00 310.00 620.00 209.00 209.00
6[Mercantile License Application 1 ™M 190.00 190.00 188.00 188.00 390.00 390.00 165.00 165.00 175.00 175.00 440.00 440.00 183.00 183.00
7|Contractor License Application 1 ™M 190.00 190.00 188.00 188.00 390.00 390.00 165.00 165.00 180.00 180.00 400.00 440.00 183.00 183.00
8|Dumpster Permit 5 C 41.00 41.00 55.00 55.00 85.00 85.00 45.00 45.00 39.00 39.00 - - 35.00 35.00
1 ™M 65.00 65.00 80.00 80.00 160.00 160.00 63.00 63.00 52.00 52.00 - - 40.00 40.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 1D $ 1,905.00 $ 1,606.00 $ 3,510.00 $ 1,381.00 $ 1,465.00 $ 1,895.00 $ 1,521.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 1D 13 8 13 8 8 4 13
1E MUNICIPAL CODE DIVISION STICKERS/LABELS
1|Concrete Stickers 5 C - - 160.00 160.00 - - 95.00 95.00 55.00 55.00 - - 105.00 105.00
1 ™M - - 220.00 220.00 - - 240.00 240.00 210.00 210.00 - - 220.00 220.00
2 M - - 280.00 280.00 - - 290.00 290.00 137.50 275.00 - - 140.00 280.00
2|Contractor Stickers 1 C - - 150.00 150.00 - - 150.00 150.00 175.00 175.00 - - 175.00 175.00
1 ™M - - 225.00 225.00 - - 210.00 210.00 220.00 220.00 - - 225.00 225.00
3|Trademark Stickers 1 C - - 280.00 280.00 - - 249.00 249.00 280.00 280.00 - - 215.00 215.00
1M - - 800.00 800.00 - - 760.00 760.00 805.00 805.00 - - 440.00 440.00
4|Equipment Stick 5 C - - 1,200.00 1,200.00 - - 485.00 485.00 655.00 655.00 - - 650.00 650.00
1 ™M - - 1,450.00 1,450.00 - - 930.00 930.00 959.00 959.00 - - 1,220.00 1,220.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 1E $ - $ 4,765.00 $ - $ 3,409.00 $ 3,634.00 $ - $ 3,530.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 1E 0] 4 4 4 0] 9
1F CONSTRUCTION CODE ENFORCEMENT FORMS
1]Inspection Door Knob Notice 5 C 65.00 65.00 70.00 70.00 175.00 175.00 65.00 65.00 67.00 67.00 - - 70.00 70.00
1 ™M 113.00 113.00 100.00 100.00 325.00 325.00 88.00 88.00 100.00 100.00 - - 105.00 105.00
2|Inspection Notice Form, UCC Form, F-200A 100 Pads 87.50 87.50 115.00 115.00 295.00 295.00 135.00 135.00 85.00 85.00 - - 90.00 90.00
3|Electrical Cut-in Card, UCC Form F-350B 1M 80.00 80.00 70.00 70.00 195.00 195.00 73.00 73.00 62.00 62.00 245.00 245.00 66.00 66.00
4|Construction Permit Notice Card, UCC Form, F-180 5 C 68.00 68.00 105.00 105.00 130.00 130.00 60.00 60.00 100.00 100.00 305.00 305.00 105.00 105.00
1 ™M 121.00 121.00 150.00 150.00 240.00 240.00 80.00 80.00 150.00 150.00 325.00 325.00 149.00 149.00
5[Construction Permit Application, UCC Form, F100-1 5 C 235.00 235.00 105.00 105.00 425.00 425.00 105.00 105.00 110.00 110.00 - - 115.00 115.00
1 ™M 333.00 333.00 195.00 195.00 800.00 800.00 140.00 140.00 190.00 190.00 - - 149.00 149.00
6[Construction Notice, Order to Vacate, UCC Form F245 5 C 68.00 68.00 80.00 80.00 130.00 130.00 70.00 70.00 73.00 73.00 310.00 310.00 75.00 75.00
1 ™M 121.00 121.00 120.00 120.00 240.00 240.00 95.00 95.00 107.00 107.00 325.00 325.00 110.00 110.00
7|Construction Notice, Filed Correction Notice 5 C 35.00 35.00 80.00 80.00 125.00 125.00 55.00 55.00 75.00 75.00 - - 61.00 61.00
1 ™M 62.00 62.00 105.00 105.00 240.00 240.00 69.00 69.00 110.00 110.00 - - 82.00 82.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 1F $ 1,388.50 $ 1,295.00 $ 3,320.00 $ 1,035.00 $ 1,229.00 $ 1,510.00 $ 1,177.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 1F 12 7 12 7 7 5 12




PURCHASING DIVISION
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, January 8, 2013 @ 2:00 PM, EST
CITY CONTRACT #: 13-04
PROPOSAL NAME: Printing Services for the City of Ocean City

NAME, ADDRESS AND AK Printing Inc. Allegra #387 (DBA) Copiers Plus, Inc. Del Val Print Solutions Express Press (DBA) GraphiColor Corporation Howe's Standard Publishing
BID OF EACH BIDDER 191 Throckmorton Street SJ Shore Marketing, LLC 3112 Fire Road 27 Chestertown Road Allegro Printing Corporation 3490 North Mill Road 1980 South West Boulevard
Freehold, NJ 07728 510 South Shore Road Egg Harbor Township, NJ 08234 Erial, NJ 08081 623 Tilton Road Vineland, NJ 08360 Vineland, NJ 08360
Marmora, NJ 08223 Northfield, NJ 08225
Adam Kleinwaks, President Nicholas J. Wieand, Owner/Operator Robert P. Matthews, President [Joseph Hughes, Jr. Richard H. Lamkin, President Robert W. Stenger, Jr., President Barry Opromollo, President
Ph: (723) 333-0031 Ph: (609) 390-1400 Ph: (609) 645-7587 Ph: (856) 344-2249 Ph: (609) 641-7060 Ph: (856) 691-2507 Ph: (856) 691-2000
Fx: (732) 333-0064 Fx: (609) 390-0217 Fx: (609) 645-1535 Fx: n/a Fx: (609) 383-0340 Fx: (856-696-3229 Fx: (856-692-4399
email: akprinting@comcast.net email: nickw@allegramarmora.com email: info@copiersplus.com email: dvprint@comcast.net email: expresspress@comcast.netlemail: graphemail@aol.com email: barry@standard-publishing.com
ITEM | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
1G CONSTRUCTION CODE ENFORCEMENT STICKERS/LABELS
1|Not Approved Stickers, UCC Form, F-230B 5 C - - 70.00 70.00 - - 72.00 72.00 170.00 170.00 - - 75.00 75.00
1 M - - 98.00 98.00 - - 96.00 96.00 210.00 210.00 - - 105.00 105.00
2|Approval Stickers-F221A Building, UCC Form, F-221 5 C - - 65.00 65.00 - - 65.00 65.00 150.00 150.00 - - 70.00 70.00
1 M - - 90.00 90.00 - - 84.00 84.00 180.00 180.00 - - 95.00 95.00
3|Approval Stickers-F222A Electrical, UCC Form F-222 5 C - - 76.00 76.00 - - 65.00 65.00 150.00 150.00 - - 80.00 80.00
1 M - - 100.00 100.00 - - 84.00 84.00 180.00 180.00 - - 105.00 105.00
Approval Stickers-F224 Fire Protection, UCC Form F-
4224 5 C - - 76.00 76.00 - - 65.00 65.00 150.00 150.00 - - 80.00 80.00
1 ™M - - 100.00 100.00 - - 84.00 84.00 180.00 180.00 - - 105.00 105.00
5|Approval Stickers-F223 Plumbing, UCC Form, F-223 5 C - - 76.00 76.00 - - 65.00 65.00 150.00 150.00 - - 80.00 80.00
1™ - - 100.00 100.00 - - 84.00 84.00 180.00 180.00 - - 105.00 105.00
6[Plan ID Stickers 5 C - - 70.00 70.00 - - 65.00 65.00 150.00 150.00 - - 150.00 150.00
1 ™M - - 98.00 98.00 - - 84.00 84.00 180.00 180.00 - - 195.00 195.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 1G $ - 1,019.00 - $ 913.00 $ 1,850.00 - $ 1,245.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 1G 0] 0] 6 0] 12
IGROUP 2.0 FINANCE DEPARTMENT
2A AIRPORT
1]Airport Parking Fee/Receipt 1M 90.00 90.00 - - 225.00 225.00 106.00 106.00 85.00 85.00 - - 89.00 89.00
2 M 137.00 137.00 - - 430.00 430.00 158.00 158.00 70.00 140.00 - - 72.50 145.00
2|Airport Invoices 5 C 79.00 79.00 - - 195.00 195.00 70.00 70.00 65.00 65.00 310.00 310.00 69.00 69.00
3|Boat Ramp Daily Passes 1 ™M 160.00 160.00 - - - - 180.00 180.00 75.00 75.00 - - 80.00 80.00
2 M 207.00 207.00 - - - - 245.00 245.00 60.00 120.00 - - 60.00 120.00
4|Boat Ramp Seasonal Passes 1M - - - - - - - - 420.00 420.00 - - 430.00 430.00
2 M - - - - - - - - 415.00 830.00 - - 415.00 830.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 2A $ 673.00 - 850.00 $ 759.00 $ 1,735.00 310.00 $ 1,763.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 2A 5 0] 3 3 4
2B PARKING REGULATIONS
1|Parking Lot Tickets 5 M 325.00 325.00 - - - - 765.00 765.00 190.00 950.00 - - 70.00 350.00
2|Hang Tags 5 M 235.00 235.00 - - 175.00 175.00 210.00 210.00 56.00 280.00 - - 56.00 280.00
3|Parking Lot Spitter Tickets 0- 10 Boxes - - - - - - - - 89.00 89.00 - - 720.00 720.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 2B $ 560.00 - 175.00 $ 975.00 $ 1,319.00 - $ 1,350.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 2B 2 0] 1 3 0]
2C TAX COLLECTION DIVISION
1|Official Search for Municipal Liens 1 ™M 265.00 265.00 - - - - 325.00 325.00 265.00 265.00 - - 300.00 300.00
2 M 471.00 471.00 - - - - 460.00 460.00 170.00 340.00 - - 180.00 360.00
2|Tax Sales Notices 5 C 185.00 185.00 - - - - 225.00 225.00 450.00 450.00 - - 395.00 395.00
1 ™M 270.00 270.00 - - - - 310.00 310.00 225.00 225.00 - - 405.00 405.00
3|Tax Refund Voucher 5 C 170.00 170.00 - - 195.00 195.00 98.00 98.00 85.00 85.00 380.00 380.00 120.00 120.00
1 ™M 269.00 269.00 - - 380.00 380.00 170.00 170.00 105.00 10.00 465.00 465.00 182.00 182.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 2C $ 1,630.00 - 575.00 $ 1,588.00 $ 1,375.00 845.00 $ 1,762.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 2C 6 0] 2 3 3




PURCHASING DIVISION
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, January 8, 2013 @ 2:00 PM, EST
CITY CONTRACT #: 13-04
PROPOSAL NAME: Printing Services for the City of Ocean City

NAME, ADDRESS AND
BID OF EACH BIDDER

AK Printing Inc.

Allegra #387 (DBA)

Copiers Plus, Inc.

Del Val Print Solutions

Express Press (DBA)

GraphiColor Corporation

Howe's Standard Publishing

191 Throckmorton Street

SJ Shore Marketing, LLC

3112 Fire Road

27 Chestertown Road

Allegro Printing Corporation

3490 North Mill Road

1980 South West Boulevard

Freehold, NJ 07728

510 South Shore Road

Egg Harbor Township, NJ 08234

Erial, NJ 08081

623 Tilton Road

Vineland, NJ 08360

Vineland, NJ 08360

Marmora, NJ 08223

Northfield, NJ 08225

Adam Kleinwaks, President

Nicholas J. Wieand, Owner/Operator

Robert P. Matthews, President

[Joseph Hughes, Jr.

Richard H. Lamkin, President

Robert W. Stenger, Jr., President

Barry Opromollo, President

Ph: (723) 333-0031

Ph: (609) 390-1400

Ph: (609) 645-7587

Ph: (856) 344-2249

Ph: (609) 641-7060

Ph: (856) 691-2507

Ph: (856) 691-2000

Fx: (732) 333-0064

Fx: (609) 390-0217

Fx: (609) 645-1535

Fx: n/a

Fx: (609) 383-0340

Fx: (856-696-3229

Fx: (856-692-4399

email: akprinting@comcast.net

email: nickw@allegramarmora.com

email: info@copiersplus.com

email: dvprint@comcast.net

email: expresspress@comcast.net]

email: graphemail@aol.com

email: barry@standard-publishing.com

ITEM | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
.GROUP 3.0 FIRE DEPARTMENT
1|Patient History 5 C 31.50 31.50 45.00 45.00 95.00 95.00 39.00 39.00 41.00 41.00 210.00 210.00 45.00 45.00
2|Privacy Pamphlet 4 M 546.00 546.00 320.00 320.00 1,000.00 1,000.00 518.00 518.00 78.75 315.00 840.00 840.00 80.00 320.00
3|Insurance Authorization/Refusal of Care Form 100 Pads 225.00 225.00 225.00 225.00 750.00 750.00 240.00 240.00 215.00 215.00 - - 225.00 225.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 3.0 $ 802.50 $ 590.00 $ 1,845.00 $ 797.00 $ 571.00 $ 1,050.00 $ 590.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 3.0 3 3 3 3 2 3
IGROUP 4.0 MUNICIPAL COURT

1|Reschedule Notice 5 C 49.00 49.00 75.00 75.00 89.00 89.00 69.00 69.00 67.00 67.00 215.00 215.00 75.00 75.00
2|Jail Commitments 5 C 70.00 70.00 88.00 88.00 110.00 110.00 68.00 68.00 65.00 65.00 240.00 240.00 65.00 65.00
3|Bail Recognizance Bond 1M 312.00 312.00 290.00 290.00 599.00 599.00 268.00 268.00 282.00 282.00 435.00 435.00 290.00 290.00
4|Authorization to Apply Bail (Waiver) 1 ™M 70.00 70.00 84.00 84.00 129.00 129.00 72.00 72.00 77.00 77.00 240.00 240.00 81.00 81.00
5|Subpoena to Testify Traffic Pad 100 Pads 358.00 358.00 250.00 250.00 - - 229.00 229.00 235.00 235.00 - - 239.00 239.00
6|Probation Order 1 C 185.00 185.00 190.00 190.00 120.00 120.00 60.00 60.00 75.00 75.00 265.00 265.00 214.00 214.00
7|Pre-Arraignment Notice Early Screening 5 C 70.00 70.00 88.00 88.00 130.00 130.00 72.00 72.00 72.00 72.00 240.00 240.00 76.00 76.00
8|Conditional Discharge Order 1 C 31.50 31.50 40.00 40.00 22.00 22.00 40.00 40.00 42.00 42.00 165.00 165.00 44.00 44.00
9|Bench Warrant 5 C 72.00 72.00 48.00 48.00 49.00 49.00 46.00 46.00 45.00 45.00 195.00 195.00 49.00 49.00
10|Order to Produce Defendant 1 C 56.50 56.50 48.00 48.00 72.00 72.00 49.00 49.00 47.00 47.00 165.00 165.00 51.00 51.00
11|Check-Off Letter 1 ™M 88.00 88.00 85.00 85.00 220.00 220.00 80.00 80.00 80.00 80.00 - - 81.00 81.00
12|Transcript Request Form 5 C 99.00 99.00 105.00 105.00 160.00 160.00 98.00 98.00 100.00 100.00 - - 107.00 107.00
13|Transcript Transmittal Letter on Appeal 5 C 99.00 99.00 105.00 105.00 160.00 160.00 98.00 98.00 100.00 100.00 - - 107.00 107.00
14|Transcript of Docket 5 C 99.00 99.00 105.00 105.00 160.00 160.00 98.00 98.00 100.00 100.00 - - 107.00 107.00
15|Notice on First Appearance 5 C 99.00 99.00 105.00 105.00 160.00 160.00 98.00 98.00 100.00 100.00 - - 107.00 107.00
16|Subpoena to Testify: Criminal 1 C 37.00 37.00 48.00 48.00 15.00 15.00 45.00 45.00 42.00 42.00 - - 46.00 46.00
17]|Amendments 5 C 31.50 31.50 40.00 40.00 29.00 29.00 38.00 38.00 37.00 37.00 - - 41.00 41.00
18|Order for Mediation 5 C 43.00 43.00 59.00 59.00 110.00 110.00 64.00 64.00 57.00 57.00 - - 61.00 61.00
19|Order for Assigned Counsel 5 C 43.00 43.00 59.00 59.00 110.00 110.00 60.00 60.00 57.00 57.00 - - 61.00 61.00
20|Notice of Appeal 2 C 31.50 31.50 44.00 44.00 44.00 44.00 42.00 42.00 45.00 45.00 - - 46.00 46.00
21[IDRC 5 C 146.00 146.00 90.00 90.00 180.00 180.00 88.00 88.00 90.00 90.00 - - 91.00 91.00
22|Notice to Defendant: 39:40-50 2 C 31.50 31.50 44.00 44.00 44.00 44.00 43.00 43.00 42.00 42.00 - - 46.00 46.00
23|Notice to Defendant: 2C:35-10 2 C 31.50 31.50 44.00 44.00 44.00 44.00 43.00 43.00 42.00 42.00 - - 46.00 46.00
24]|Request for Dismissal/Void 2 C 111.00 111.00 52.00 52.00 26.00 26.00 45.00 45.00 60.00 60.00 - - 49.00 49.00
25|Plea Entered Pad 2 C 165.00 165.00 35.00 35.00 250.00 250.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 35.00 - - 32.00 32.00
26|Bail Receipt 20 Books 243.00 243.00 120.00 120.00 - - 108.00 108.00 140.00 140.00 - - 112.00 112.00
27|Memo Form 5 C 31.50 31.50 45.00 45.00 55.00 55.00 45.00 45.00 42.00 42.00 - - 46.00 46.00
28|Notice to Defendant (39:3-40) 2 C 43.00 43.00 45.00 45.00 44.00 44.00 43.00 43.00 42.00 42.00 - - 46.00 46.00
29|Public Defender Letter 5 C 26.50 26.50 20.00 20.00 25.00 25.00 28.00 28.00 20.00 20.00 - - 20.00 20.00
30|Prisoner Video Request 25 C 72.50 72.50 15.00 15.00 18.00 18.00 16.00 16.00 15.00 15.00 - - 15.00 15.00
31|Fax Transmittal 5 C 26.50 26.50 30.00 30.00 35.00 35.00 28.00 28.00 20.00 20.00 - - 20.00 20.00
32|Pre-Trial Intervention 25 C 72.50 72.50 15.00 15.00 18.00 18.00 16.00 16.00 15.00 15.00 - - 15.00 15.00
33|Request ion for Criminal History Information 25 C 177.00 177.00 20.00 20.00 85.00 85.00 16.00 16.00 15.00 15.00 - - 20.00 20.00
34|Financial Questionnaire 25 C 290.00 290.00 35.00 35.00 70.00 70.00 65.00 65.00 32.00 32.00 - - 65.00 65.00




PURCHASING DIVISION
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, January 8, 2013 @ 2:00 PM, EST
CITY CONTRACT #: 13-04
PROPOSAL NAME: Printing Services for the City of Ocean City

NAME, ADDRESS AND AK Printing Inc. Allegra #387 (DBA) Copiers Plus, Inc. Del Val Print Solutions Express Press (DBA) GraphiColor Corporation Howe's Standard Publishing
BID OF EACH BIDDER 191 Throckmorton Street SJ Shore Marketing, LLC 3112 Fire Road 27 Chestertown Road Allegro Printing Corporation 3490 North Mill Road 1980 South West Boulevard
Freehold, NJ 07728 510 South Shore Road Egg Harbor Township, NJ 08234 Erial, NJ 08081 623 Tilton Road Vineland, NJ 08360 Vineland, NJ 08360
Marmora, NJ 08223 Northfield, NJ 08225
Adam Kleinwaks, President Nicholas J. Wieand, Owner/Operator Robert P. Matthews, President [Joseph Hughes, Jr. Richard H. Lamkin, President Robert W. Stenger, Jr., President Barry Opromollo, President
Ph: (723) 333-0031 Ph: (609) 390-1400 Ph: (609) 645-7587 Ph: (856) 344-2249 Ph: (609) 641-7060 Ph: (856) 691-2507 Ph: (856) 691-2000
Fx: (732) 333-0064 Fx: (609) 390-0217 Fx: (609) 645-1535 Fx: n/a Fx: (609) 383-0340 Fx: (856-696-3229 Fx: (856-692-4399
email: akprinting@comcast.net email: nickw@allegramarmora.com email: info@copiersplus.com email: dvprint@comcast.net email: expresspress@comcast.netlemail: graphemail@aol.com email: barry@standard-publishing.com
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
35| Notification of Bail Posted 5 C 26.50 26.50 20.00 20.00 35.00 35.00 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00 - - 20.00 20.00
36| Termination of Seasonal Lease 1 C 42.00 42.00 7.00 7.00 57.00 57.00 10.00 10.00 5.00 5.00 - - 5.00 5.00
37|Case History, Traffic Pad 25 C 175.00 175.00 40.00 40.00 550.00 550.00 - - 30.00 30.00 - - 40.00 40.00
38|Case History, Criminal Pad 25 C 28.00 28.00 44.00 44.00 1,950.00 1,950.00 20.00 20.00 30.00 30.00 - - 40.00 40.00
39]Judgment Entered, Quasi Criminal Traffic 25 C 53.00 53.00 18.00 18.00 67.00 67.00 20.00 20.00 15.00 15.00 - - 18.00 18.00
40|Mediation Agreement 25 C 49.00 49.00 82.00 82.00 80.00 80.00 63.00 63.00 77.00 77.00 - - 81.00 81.00
41|Bail Sign-Out Sheet 1 C 17.00 17.00 5.00 5.00 15.00 15.00 8.00 8.00 5.00 5.00 - - 5.00 5.00
42|Video Conferencing Program Report 1 C 17.00 17.00 5.00 5.00 15.00 15.00 8.00 8.00 5.00 5.00 - - 5.00 5.00
43|Appeal Package 50 Each 88.00 88.00 24.00 24.00 39.00 39.00 28.00 28.00 22.00 22.00 - - 20.00 20.00
44|Certified Transcript of Docket 1 C 27.00 27.00 24.00 24.00 25.00 25.00 22.00 22.00 22.00 22.00 - - 21.00 21.00
45[Suggestions, Customer Survey 20 Pads 36.00 36.00 44.00 44.00 55.00 55.00 32.00 32.00 35.00 35.00 - - 35.00 35.00
46[Records Request 2 27.00 27.00 32.00 32.00 25.00 25.00 30.00 30.00 28.00 28.00 - - 31.00 31.00
47|Conditional Discharge Final Disposition Report 100 Each 17.00 17.00 5.00 5.00 15.00 15.00 15.00 15.00 5.00 5.00 - - 5.00 5.00
48|Drug Restraining Order 1 33.00 33.00 40.00 40.00 49.00 49.00 35.00 35.00 32.00 32.00 - - 36.00 36.00
Judgment of Default on Forfeited Corporate Bail
49[Bonds and Notice of Removal 250 Each 59.00 59.00 65.00 65.00 90.00 90.00 62.00 62.00 62.00 62.00 - - 66.00 66.00
50|Case History, CDR Criminal Pad 25 C 27.00 27.00 32.00 32.00 - - 25.00 25.00 24.00 24.00 - - 20.00 20.00
5 C 36.50 36.50 36.00 36.00 - - 45.00 45.00 32.00 32.00 - - 35.00 35.00
51|Interpreter Time Sheet Pad 25 C 17.00 17.00 15.00 15.00 17.00 17.00 14.00 14.00 15.00 15.00 - - 15.00 15.00
5 C 26.00 26.00 25.00 25.00 35.00 35.00 16.00 16.00 25.00 25.00 - - 25.00 25.00
52|Quantum Interpreter Service Time Sheet 25 C 17.00 17.00 12.00 12.00 17.00 17.00 18.00 18.00 15.00 15.00 - - 12.00 12.00
5 C 26.00 26.00 18.00 18.00 35.00 35.00 29.00 29.00 19.00 19.00 - - 18.00 18.00
53|Records Request Response List 25 C 17.00 17.00 12.00 12.00 17.00 17.00 18.00 18.00 15.00 15.00 - - 12.00 12.00
5 C 26.00 26.00 18.00 18.00 35.00 35.00 29.00 29.00 19.00 19.00 - - 18.00 18.00
54|NJ Judiciary M.C. Records Request 5 C 26.00 26.00 18.00 18.00 35.00 35.00 28.00 28.00 19.00 19.00 - - 18.00 18.00
1 ™M 35.00 35.00 28.00 28.00 70.00 70.00 46.00 46.00 25.00 25.00 - - 22.00 22.00
55|Request to Approve Plea Agreement 2 C 27.00 27.00 18.00 18.00 - - - - 15.00 15.00 - - 15.00 15.00
5 C 36.50 36.50 29.00 29.00 - - - - 25.00 25.00 - - 28.00 28.00
56|Plea by Mail 2 C 31.00 31.00 32.00 32.00 44.00 44.00 33.00 33.00 28.00 28.00 - - 31.00 31.00
5 C 43.00 43.00 50.00 50.00 110.00 110.00 56.00 56.00 48.00 48.00 - - 51.00 51.00
57|Meter Inspection/Repair Request 5 C 164.00 164.00 80.00 80.00 - - 73.00 73.00 78.00 78.00 - - 82.00 82.00
58|Sound Recording Log Pad 10 Pads 45.00 45.00 32.00 32.00 90.00 90.00 48.00 48.00 30.00 30.00 - - 32.00 32.00
59|Personal Injury Ticket Transmittal Form 50 Each 11.00 11.00 5.00 5.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 10.00 5.00 5.00 - - 5.00 5.00
60|Payment of Fines 1 C 18.00 18.00 25.00 25.00 22.00 22.00 25.00 25.00 22.00 22.00 - - 27.00 27.00
61|Notice to Defendant Following Conviction 39:3-40 1 C 18.00 18.00 25.00 25.00 22.00 22.00 21.00 21.00 22.00 22.00 - - 27.00 27.00
62|Jail Discharge 5 C 26.50 26.50 18.00 18.00 35.00 35.00 20.00 20.00 20.00 20.00 - - 18.00 18.00
63]|Filing a Complaint in Municipal Court 25 C 87.50 87.50 30.00 30.00 88.00 88.00 90.00 90.00 28.00 28.00 - - 30.00 30.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 4.0 $ 4,867.00 3,579.00 $ 7,131.00 $ 3,330.00 $ 3,257.00 $ 2,160.00 $ 3,540.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 4.0 70 63 63 61 63 10 54




PURCHASING DIVISION
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, January 8, 2013 @ 2:00 PM, EST
CITY CONTRACT #: 13-04
PROPOSAL NAME: Printing Services for the City of Ocean City

NAME, ADDRESS AND
BID OF EACH BIDDER

AK Printing Inc.

Allegra #387 (DBA)

Copiers Plus, Inc.

Del Val Print Solutions

Express Press (DBA)

GraphiColor Corporation

Howe's Standard Publishing

191 Throckmorton Street

SJ Shore Marketing, LLC

3112 Fire Road

27 Chestertown Road

Allegro Printing Corporation

3490 North Mill Road

1980 South West Boulevard

Freehold, NJ 07728

510 South Shore Road

Egg Harbor Township, NJ 08234

Erial, NJ 08081

623 Tilton Road

Vineland, NJ 08360

Vineland, NJ 08360

Marmora, NJ 08223

Northfield, NJ 08225

Adam Kleinwaks, President

Nicholas J. Wieand, Owner/Operator

Robert P. Matthews, President

[Joseph Hughes, Jr.

Richard H. Lamkin, President

Robert W. Stenger, Jr., President

Barry Opromollo, President

Ph: (723) 333-0031

Ph: (609) 390-1400

Ph: (609) 645-7587

Ph: (856) 344-2249

Ph: (609) 641-7060

Ph: (856) 691-2507

Ph: (856) 691-2000

Fx: (732) 333-0064

Fx: (609) 390-0217

Fx: (609) 645-1535

Fx: n/a

Fx: (609) 383-0340

Fx: (856-696-3229

Fx: (856-692-4399

email: akprinting@comcast.net

email: nickw@allegramarmora.com

email: info@copiersplus.com

email: dvprint@comcast.net

email: expresspress@comcast.net]

email: graphemail@aol.com

email: barry@standard-publishing.com

1TEM | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
IGROUP 5.0 POLICE DEPARTMENT
5A POLICE DEPARTMENT FORMS
1|Found Property/Evidence Tag 2 M 685.00 685.00 - - - - 115.00 115.00 105.00 210.00 - - 106.00 212.00
2|Miranda Warning & Waiver of Assertion 1™ 72.00 72.00 - - 250.00 250.00 68.00 68.00 75.00 75.00 - - 70.00 70.00
3|Storage Receipts for Towing 5 C 68.00 68.00 - - 125.00 125.00 75.00 75.00 70.00 70.00 - - 81.00 81.00
1™ 123.00 123.00 - - 250.00 250.00 99.00 99.00 122.00 122.00 - - 122.00 122.00
4|Open Property Cards 5 C 85.00 85.00 - - 62.00 62.00 51.00 51.00 72.00 72.00 - - 72.00 72.00
5|Evidence Tag 5 C 85.00 85.00 - - 62.00 62.00 51.00 51.00 85.00 85.00 - - 72.00 72.00
6|Tow Sheets 5 C 125.00 125.00 - - 130.00 130.00 89.00 89.00 85.00 85.00 - - 92.00 92.00
7|Parking Permit-Official Use Only 2 C 110.00 110.00 - - 50.00 50.00 49.00 49.00 57.00 57.00 - - 60.00 60.00
8|Warning Notice 5 C 56.00 56.00 - - 135.00 135.00 41.00 41.00 40.00 40.00 - - 50.00 50.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 5A $ 1,409.00 - $ 1,064.00 $ 638.00 $ 816.00 $ - $ 831.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 5A 9 0 8 0
5B POLICE DEPARTMENT STICKERS/LABELS
1|Abandoned Car Stickers 5 C - - 130.00 130.00 - - 165.00 165.00 125.00 125.00 - - 205.00 205.00
2|Bicycle License Decal 5 C - - 230.00 230.00 - - 138.00 138.00 220.00 220.00 - - 320.00 320.00
3|Boat License Decal 2 C - - 245.00 245.00 - - 268.00 268.00 240.00 240.00 - - 330.00 330.00
4[Beach Vehicle Permit Decal 5 C - - 280.00 280.00 - - 295.00 295.00 275.00 275.00 - - 382.00 382.00
5|Accident Car Stickers 5 C - - 150.00 150.00 - - 260.00 260.00 140.00 140.00 - - 190.00 190.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 5B $ - 1,035.00 $ - $ 1,126.00 $ 1,000.00 $ - $ 1,427.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 5B 0 0 5 5 0
(GROUP 6.0 PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT
6A PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT FORMS
1|Recycling Guidelines Brochure 5 M 356.00 356.00 500.00 500.00 - - 415.00 415.00 86.00 430.00 - - 88.00 440.00
10 M 655.00 655.00 895.00 895.00 - - 710.00 710.00 76.00 760.00 - - 70.00 700.00
2|Postcard Guidelines Recycling 5 M 197.50 197.50 235.00 235.00 1,200.00 1,200.00 120.00 120.00 42.00 210.00 - - 44.00 220.00
10 M 332.50 332.50 395.00 395.00 2,000.00 2,000.00 195.00 195.00 32.50 325.00 - - 34.00 340.00
3|Equipment Work Order 5 C 82.00 82.00 90.00 90.00 125.00 125.00 57.00 57.00 60.00 60.00 - - 65.00 65.00
4|Vehicle Check List 2 C 26.50 26.50 20.00 20.00 15.00 15.00 16.00 16.00 25.00 25.00 - - 25.00 25.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 6A $ 1,649.50 2,135.00 $ 3,340.00 $ 1,513.00 $ 1,810.00 $ - $ 1,790.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 6A 6 4 4 4 0




PURCHASING DIVISION
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, January 8, 2013 @ 2:00 PM, EST
CITY CONTRACT #: 13-04
PROPOSAL NAME: Printing Services for the City of Ocean City

NAME, ADDRESS AND
BID OF EACH BIDDER

AK Printing Inc.

Allegra #387 (DBA)

Copiers Plus, Inc.

Del Val Print Solutions

Express Press (DBA)

GraphiColor Corporation

Howe's Standard Publishing

191 Throckmorton Street

SJ Shore Marketing, LLC

3112 Fire Road

27 Chestertown Road

Allegro Printing Corporation

3490 North Mill Road

1980 South West Boulevard

Freehold, NJ 07728

510 South Shore Road

Egg Harbor Township, NJ 08234

Erial, NJ 08081

623 Tilton Road

Vineland, NJ 08360

Vineland, NJ 08360

Marmora, NJ 08223

Northfield, NJ 08225

Adam Kleinwaks, President

Nicholas J. Wieand, Owner/Operator

Robert P. Matthews, President

[Joseph Hughes, Jr.

Richard H. Lamkin, President

Robert W. Stenger, Jr., President

Barry Opromollo, President

Ph: (723) 333-0031

Ph: (609) 390-1400

Ph: (609) 645-7587

Ph: (856) 344-2249

Ph: (609) 641-7060

Ph: (856) 691-2507

Ph: (856) 691-2000

Fx: (732) 333-0064

Fx: (609) 390-0217

Fx: (609) 645-1535

Fx: n/a

Fx: (609) 383-0340

Fx: (856-696-3229

Fx: (856-692-4399

email: akprinting@comcast.net

email: nickw@allegramarmora.com

email: info@copiersplus.com

email: dvprint@comcast.net

email: expresspress@comcast.net]

email: graphemail@aol.com

email: barry@standard-publishing.com

ITEM | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
6B PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT STICKERS/LABELS
1|Return Address Label 5 C - - - - - - 165.00 165.00 175.00 175.00 - - 105.00 105.00
2|Recycling Stickers-Paper 5 M - - - - - - - - 703.00 3,515.00 - - 542.00 2,710.00
10 M - - - - - - - - 599.50 5,995.00 - - 381.00 3,810.00
3|Recycling Stickers-Bottles & Cans 5 M - - - - - - - - 703.00 3,515.00 - - 542.00 2,710.00
10 M - - - - - - - - 599.50 5,995.00 - - 381.00 3,810.00
4|Recycling Stickers-Yard Waste 5 M - - - - - - - - 703.00 3,515.00 - - 542.00 2,710.00
10 M - - - - - - - - 599.50 5,995.00 - - 381.00 3,810.00
5|Trash & Litter Stickers 5 M - - - - - - - - 703.00 3,515.00 - - 542.00 2,710.00
10 M - - - - - - - - 599.50 5,995.00 - - 381.00 3,810.00
6|Recycling Guidelines Magnets-Residents 5 M - - - - - - 1,431.00 1,431.00 299.00 1,495.00 - - 249.00 1,245.00
10 M - - - - - - 2,595.00 2,595.00 259.50 2,595.00 - - 220.00 2,200.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 6B $ - $ - $ - $ 4,191.00 $ 42,305.00 $ - $ 29,630.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 6B 0] 0] 0] 2 6 0] 11
IGROUP 7.0 TOURISM DEVELOPMENT
1|Summer Brochure 50 M $ 5,831.00 | $ 5,831.00 | $ 4,425.00 | $ 4,425.00 | $ - $ $ - $ - $ 129.00 | $ 6,450.00 | $ 112.00 | $ 5,600.00 | $ 103.20 | $ 5,160.00
100 ™ $ 9,499.00 | $ 9,499.00 | $ 7,150.00 | $ 7,150.00 | $ - $ $ - $ - $ 9250 | $ 9,250.00 | $ 101.88 | $ 10,188.00 | $ 97.90 | $ 9,790.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 7.0 $ 15,330.00 $ 11,575.00 $ - $ - $ 15,700.00 $ 15,788.00 $ 14,950.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 7.0 2 0] 0] 1 1
.GROUP 8.0 LETTERHEAD
1|Letterhead 1 ™M 63.50 63.50 115.00 115.00 - 90.00 90.00 90.00 90.00 670.00 670.00 140.00 140.00
5 M 340.00 340.00 290.00 290.00 - 270.00 270.00 53.00 265.00 282.00 1,410.00 56.00 280.00
10 M 650.00 650.00 460.00 460.00 - 465.00 465.00 43.50 435.00 208.10 2,081.00 50.50 505.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 8.0 $ 1,053.50 $ 865.00 $ - $ 825.00 $ 790.00 $ 4,161.00 $ 925.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 8.0 3 0] 1
IGROUP 9.0 (NO ITEMS)




PURCHASING DIVISION
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, January 8, 2013 @ 2:00 PM, EST
CITY CONTRACT #: 13-04
PROPOSAL NAME: Printing Services for the City of Ocean City

NAME, ADDRESS AND AK Printing Inc. Allegra #387 (DBA) Copiers Plus, Inc. Del Val Print Solutions Express Press (DBA) GraphiColor Corporation Howe's Standard Publishing
BID OF EACH BIDDER 191 Throckmorton Street SJ Shore Marketing, LLC 3112 Fire Road 27 Chestertown Road Allegro Printing Corporation 3490 North Mill Road 1980 South West Boulevard
Freehold, NJ 07728 510 South Shore Road Egg Harbor Township, NJ 08234 Erial, NJ 08081 623 Tilton Road Vineland, NJ 08360 Vineland, NJ 08360
Marmora, NJ 08223 Northfield, NJ 08225
Adam Kleinwaks, President Nicholas J. Wieand, Owner/Operator Robert P. Matthews, President [Joseph Hughes, Jr. Richard H. Lamkin, President Robert W. Stenger, Jr., President Barry Opromollo, President
Ph: (723) 333-0031 Ph: (609) 390-1400 Ph: (609) 645-7587 Ph: (856) 344-2249 Ph: (609) 641-7060 Ph: (856) 691-2507 Ph: (856) 691-2000
Fx: (732) 333-0064 Fx: (609) 390-0217 Fx: (609) 645-1535 Fx: n/a Fx: (609) 383-0340 Fx: (856-696-3229 Fx: (856-692-4399
email: akprinting@comcast.net email: nickw@allegramarmora.com email: info@copiersplus.com email: dvprint@comcast.net email: expresspress@comcast.netlemail: graphemail@aol.com email: barry@standard-publishing.com
ITEM | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
.GROUP 10.0 ENVELOPES
1|Standardized Envelopes-to match letterhead 5 C 86.00 86.00 - - - 68.00 68.00 55.00 55.00 255.00 255.00 60.00 60.00
1 M 136.00 136.00 - - - 114.00 114.00 70.00 70.00 380.00 380.00 90.00 90.00
5 M 455.00 455.00 - - - 492.00 492.00 58.60 293.00 220.00 1,100.00 69.00 345.00
2|Fire Division Envelopes 5 C 105.00 105.00 - - - 90.00 90.00 170.00 170.00 - - 65.00 65.00
1 M 181.00 181.00 - - - 150.00 150.00 270.00 270.00 - - 80.00 80.00
3|Fire Prevention Envelopes 5 C 39.00 39.00 - - - 50.00 50.00 50.00 50.00 275.00 275.00 40.00 40.00
4|Envelopes #10 Regular 5 C 39.00 39.00 - 99.00 99.00 40.00 40.00 40.00 40.00 90.00 90.00 44.00 44.00
1 ™M 62.00 62.00 - 225.00 225.00 55.00 55.00 58.00 58.00 100.00 100.00 60.00 60.00
5 M 220.00 220.00 - - - 160.00 160.00 42.40 212.00 48.00 240.00 40.00 200.00
5|Envelopes #10 Window 1 ™M 62.00 62.00 - - - 59.00 59.00 58.00 58.00 120.00 120.00 60.00 60.00
5 M 220.00 220.00 - - - 180.00 180.00 42.40 212.00 54.00 270.00 42.00 210.00
10 M 370.00 370.00 - - - 330.00 330.00 39.00 390.00 42.00 420.00 38.50 385.00
25 M 875.00 875.00 - - - 730.00 730.00 36.60 915.00 40.00 1,000.00 36.60 915.00
6[Recycling Envelopes #10 1 ™M 80.00 80.00 - - - 59.00 59.00 65.00 65.00 165.00 165.00 75.00 75.00
5 M 320.00 320.00 - - - 182.00 182.00 54.00 270.00 76.00 380.00 50.00 250.00
10 M 580.00 580.00 - - - 275.00 275.00 44.30 443.00 61.00 610.00 45.00 450.00
7|Revenue Collection Envelopes 1 ™M 72.00 72.00 - - - 72.00 72.00 55.00 55.00 145.00 145.00 50.00 50.00
5 M 245.00 245.00 - - - 285.00 285.00 41.00 205.00 55.00 275.00 42.00 210.00
10 M 460.00 460.00 - - - 540.00 540.00 37.20 372.00 47.00 470.00 39.50 395.00
8|Marriage License Envelopes 5 C 84.00 84.00 - - - - - 95.00 95.00 235.00 235.00 95.00 95.00
9|Human Resources Envelopes 5 C 166.00 166.00 - 199.00 199.00 198.00 198.00 250.00 250.00 - - 110.00 110.00
9|Licensing Envelopes
(a) blue 5 M 245.00 245.00 - - - 245.00 245.00 48.20 241.00 55.00 275.00 48.00 240.00
(b) pink 5 M 245.00 245.00 - - - 245.00 245.00 48.20 241.00 55.00 275.00 48.00 240.00
(c) green 5 M 245.00 245.00 - - - 245.00 245.00 48.20 241.00 55.00 275.00 48.00 240.00
(d) yellow 5 M 245.00 245.00 - - - 245.00 245.00 48.20 241.00 55.00 275.00 48.00 240.00
10]Music Pier Box Office Envelopes 5 C 34.00 34.00 - - - 45.00 45.00 50.00 50.00 120.00 120.00 50.00 50.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 10.0 $ 5,871.00 $ - $ 523.00 $ 5,154.00 $ 5,562.00 $ 7,750.00 $ 5,199.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 10.0 25 0] 3 10 11 10 26




PURCHASING DIVISION
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, January 8, 2013 @ 2:00 PM, EST
CITY CONTRACT #: 13-04
PROPOSAL NAME: Printing Services for the City of Ocean City

NAME, ADDRESS AND
BID OF EACH BIDDER

AK Printing Inc.

Allegra #387 (DBA)

Copiers Plus, Inc.

Del Val Print Solutions

Express Press (DBA)

GraphiColor Corporation

Howe's Standard Publishing

191 Throckmorton Street

SJ Shore Marketing, LLC

3112 Fire Road

27 Chestertown Road

Allegro Printing Corporation

3490 North Mill Road

1980 South West Boulevard

Freehold, NJ 07728

510 South Shore Road

Egg Harbor Township, NJ 08234

Erial, NJ 08081

623 Tilton Road

Vineland, NJ 08360

Vineland, NJ 08360

Marmora, NJ 08223

Northfield, NJ 08225

Adam Kleinwaks, President

Nicholas J. Wieand, Owner/Operator

Robert P. Matthews, President

[Joseph Hughes, Jr.

Richard H. Lamkin, President

Robert W. Stenger, Jr., President

Barry Opromollo, President

Ph: (723) 333-0031

Ph: (609) 390-1400

Ph: (609) 645-7587

Ph: (856) 344-2249

Ph: (609) 641-7060

Ph: (856) 691-2507

Ph: (856) 691-2000

Fx: (732) 333-0064

Fx: (609) 390-0217

Fx: (609) 645-1535

Fx: n/a

Fx: (609) 383-0340

Fx: (856-696-3229

Fx: (856-692-4399

email: akprinting@comcast.net

email: nickw@allegramarmora.com

email: info@copiersplus.com

email: dvprint@comcast.net

email: expresspress@comcast.net]

email: graphemail@aol.com

email: barry@standard-publishing.com

ITEM | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
GROUP 11.0 BUSINESS CARDS
1|City Business Cards 5 C - - - - - - 90.00 90.00 52.00 52.00 - - 115.00 115.00
1 M - - - - - - 121.00 121.00 56.00 56.00 - - 176.00 176.00
5 M - - - - - - 360.00 360.00 53.20 266.00 - - 110.00 550.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 11.0 $ - $ 571.00 $ 374.00 $ - $ 841.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 11.0 9] 0 9] 1 1 0 3
TOTAL DOLLAR AMOUNT OF ALL ITEMS/GROUPS BID $ 22,254.50 $ 33,481.00 $ 28,684.00 $ 15,191.00 $ 40,862.00 $ 42,484.00 $ 77,250.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF GROUPS BID 13 13 7 19 20 7 20
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID 30 123 136 147 158 55 209
Required Information
RIGHT TO EXTEND-TIME FOR AWARD:, YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE STATEMENT:| YES/NO M YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT: YES/NO Y YES/NO M YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
NJ MANDATORY EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY LANGUAGE: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO M YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
NJ AFFIRMATIVE ACTION COMPLIANCE NOTICE: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF RECEIPT OF ADDENDA: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE (BRC) SUBMITTED : YES/NO N YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO M YES/NO M




PURCHASING DIVISION
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

CITY OF OCEAN CITY

AMERICA'S GREATEST FAMILY RESORT

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesaday, Janaury 8, 2013

CITY CONTRACT #: 13-04

PROPOSAL NAME: Printing Services for the City of Ocean City &
The Ocean City Board of Education

NAME, ADDRESS AND AK Printing Inc. Allegra #387 (DBA) Copiers Plus, Inc. Del Val Print Solutions Express Press (DBA) GraphiColor Corporation Howe's Standard Publishing
BID OF EACH BIDDER 191 Throckmorton Street SJ Shore Marketing, LLC 3112 Fire Road 27 Chestertown Road Allegro Printing Corporation 3490 North Mill Road 1980 South West Boulevard
Freehold, NJ 07728 510 South Shore Road Egg Harbor Twonship, NJ 08234 |Erial, NJ 08081 623 Tilton Road Vineland, NJ 08360 Vineland, NJ 08360
Marmora, NJ 08223 Northfield, NJ 08225
Adam Kleinwaks, President Nicholas J. Wieand, Owner/Operator Robert P. Matthews, President Joseph Hughes, Jr. Richard H. Lamkin, President Robert W. Stenger, Jr., President Barry Opromollo, President
Ph: (723) 333-0031 Ph: (609) 390-1400 Ph: (609) 645-7587 Ph: (856) 344-2249 Ph: (609) 641-7060 Ph: (856) 691-2507 Ph: (856) 691-2000
Fx: (732) 333-0064 Fx: (609) 390-0217 Fx: (609) 645-1535 Fx: n/a Fx: (609) 383-0340 Fx: (856) 696-3229 Fx: (856-692-4399
email: akprinting@comcast.net email: nickw@allegramarmora.com email:_infor @ copiersplus.com email: dvprint@comcast.net email: expresspress@comcast.net email: graphemail@aol.com email: barry@standard-publishing.com
NO-BID NO-BID
1TEM | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
GROUP 1.0 -HIGH SCHOOL
1|Literary Magazine H.S. 2 C $ - $ - $ - $ $ - $ - $ 1,795.00 | $ 1,795.00 | $ 987.50 | $ 1,975.00 | $ - $ - $ 2,885.00 | $ 2,885.00
2|Late Bus Passes (100/pad) 1C_Pad $ - $ - $ - $ $ - $ - $ 61.00 [ $ 61.00] $ 125($ 125.001 $ - $ - $ 85.00 | $ 85.00
3|Pass (500/pad) 5C Pad $ - $ - $ - $ $ - $ - $ 168.00 | $ 168.00| $ 081 |$ 405.00 | $ - $ - $ 280.00 | $ 280.00
4|Student/Parent Handbook Calendar 2 M $ - $ - $ - $ $ - $ - $ 132.00 | $ 132.00 | $ 1,150.00 | $ 2,300.00 | $ - $ - $ 1,220.00 | $ 2,440.00
5|Certificate of Award 5 C $ - $ - $ - $ $ - $ - $ 143.00 | $ 143.00] $ 37.00($ 185.00| $ - $ - $ 75.00 | $ 75.00
6|Activity Events/Programs
(a) Academic Awards Program 5 C $ - $ - $ - $ $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 72.00 | $ 360.00| $ - $ - $ 250.00 | $ 250.00
(b) Baccalaureate Program 5 C $ - $ - $ - $ $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 90.00 | $ 450.00 | $ - $ - $ 280.00 | $ 280.00
(c) Graduation Program 4 M $ - $ - $ - $ $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 186.25 | $ 745.00| $ - $ - $ 17375 | $ 695.00
7|Discipline Referral 1 M $ - $ - $ - $ $ 110.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 55.00 [ $ 55.00 ) $ 240.00 | $ 240.00 | $ - $ - $ 66.00 | $ 66.00
8|Notice of Suspension/Incident Report 5 C $ - $ - $ - $ $ 110.00 | $ 110.00] $ 55.00 [ $ 55.00] $ 16.00 | $ 80.00] $ - $ - $ 61.00 | $ 61.00
9|Student Activities Account
white 2 _C $ - $ - $ - $ $ - $ - $ 18.00 | $ 18.00] $ 750 $ 15.001 % - $ - $ 2500 | $ 25.00
blue 2 ¢C $ - $ - $ - $ $ - $ - $ 21.00 [ $ 21.00) $ 750 $ 15.00}) $ - $ - $ 30.00 | $ 30.00
10{Ocean City High School Graduation Tickets
(a) color to be determined 4 M $ - $ - $ - $ $ - $ - $ 56.00 | $ 56.00 | $ 43.75 | $ 175.00 ] $ - $ - $ 1250 | $ 50.00
(b) color to be determined 15 M $ - $ - $ - $ $ - $ - $ 31.00($ 31.00} $ 50.00 [ $ 75.00] % - $ - $ 26.60 | $ 40.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 1.0 $ - $ $ 220.00 $ 2,535.00 $ 7,145.00 $ - $ 7,262.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 1.0 [0] o] 2 9 10 0 14
GROUP 2.0-INTERMEDIATE SCHOOL, MAIN OFFICE
1|Early Dismissal Slip 5 C $ - $ - $ - $ $ - $ - $ 40.00 [ $ 40.00 ] $ 9.00 | $ 45.00 ] $ - $ - $ 40.00 | $ 40.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 2.0 $ - $ $ - $ 40.00 $ 45.00 $ - $ 40.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 2.0 0 0 0 1 1 0 0
GROUP 3.0- INTERMEDIATE SCHOOL, GUIDANCE OFFICE
1|Cumu|ative Folders/File Type 1 BOX $ - $ - $ - $ $ - $ - $ 58.00 [ $ 58.00] $ 130.00 | $ 130.00] $ - $ - $ 105.00 | $ 105.00
2|Student Registration Sheet 2 PKG $ - $ - $ - $ $ 104.00 | $ 104.00 | $ 82.00 [ $ 82.00] $ 3750 [ $ 75.00 ) $ - $ - $ 70.00 | $ 70.00
3|Student Health Record 1 C $ - $ - $ - $ $ - $ - $ 96.00 [ $ 96.00] $ 125.00 | $ 125.00] $ - $ - $ 35.00|$ 35.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 3.0 $ - $ $ 104.00 $ 236.00 $ 330.00 $ - $ 210.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 3.0 0 0 1 3 3 0 3




PURCHASING DIVISION
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

CITY OF OCEAN CITY

AMERICA'S GREATEST FAMILY RESORT

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesaday, Janaury 8, 2013

CITY CONTRACT #: 13-04

PROPOSAL NAME: Printing Services for the City of Ocean City &
The Ocean City Board of Education

NAME, ADDRESS AND
BID OF EACH BIDDER

AK Printing Inc.

Allegra #387 (DBA)

Copiers Plus, Inc.

Del Val Print Solutions

Express Press (DBA)

GraphiColor Corporation

Howe's Standard Publishing

191 Throckmorton Street

SJ Shore Marketing, LLC

3112 Fire Road

27 Chestertown Road

Allegro Printing Corporation

3490 North Mill Road

1980 South West Boulevard

Freehold, NJ 07728

510 South Shore Road

Egg Harbor Twonship, NJ 08234

Erial, NJ 08081

623 Tilton Road

Vineland, NJ 08360

Vineland, NJ 08360

Marmora, NJ 08223

Northfield, NJ 08225

Adam Kleinwaks, President

Nicholas J. Wieand, Owner/Operator

Robert P. Matthews, President

Joseph Hughes, Jr.

Richard H. Lamkin, President

Robert W. Stenger, Jr., President

Barry Opromollo, President

Ph: (723) 333-0031

Ph: (609) 390-1400

Ph: (609) 645-7587

Ph: (856) 344-2249

Ph: (609) 641-7060

Ph: (856) 691-2507

Ph: (856) 691-2000

Fx: (732) 333-0064

Fx: (609) 390-0217

Fx: (609) 645-1535

Fx: n/a

Fx: (609) 383-0340

Fx: (856) 696-3229

Fx: (856-692-4399

email: akprinting@comcast.net

email: nickw@allegramarmora.com

email:_infor @ copiersplus.com

email: dvprint@comcast.net

email: expresspress@comcast.net

email: graphemail@aol.com

email: barry@standard-publishing.com

NO-BID NO-BID
1TEM | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
GROUP 4.0-OFFICE OF THE SUPERINTENDENT
1|Request to be Absent Form 4 M $ 407.00 [ $ 407.00]1 $ - $ - $ 640.00 | $ 640.00 ] $ 249.00 [ $ 249.00] $ 68.75 | $ 275.00] $ - $ $ 7875 $ 315.00
2|Professional Leave Request Form 2 M $ 280.00 | $ 280.00 | $ - $ - $ 520.00 | $ 520.00 | $ 161.00 | $ 161.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 220.00| $ - $ $ 112.50 | $ 225.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 4.0 $ 687.00 $ - $ 1,160.00 $ 410.00 $ 495.00 $ $ 540.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 4.0 2 0 2 2 2 0 2
GROUP 5.0 PRIMARY SCHOOL
1|Early Dismissal Slips 1 M $ 41.00 | $ 41.00]$ - $ - $ 60.00 | $ 60.00 ] $ 40.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 45.00 ]| $ - $ $ 45.00 | $ 45.00
2[Tardy Admit Slips 1 ™M $ 74.00 | $ 74.001$ - $ - $ - $ - $ 40.00 | $ 40.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 45.00 | $ - $ $ 45.00 | $ 45.00
3|Cumulative Folders 1 C $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 48.00 | $ 48.00 | $ 115.00 | $ 115.00) $ - $ $ 95.00 | $ 95.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS IN GROUP 5.0 $ 115.00 $ - $ 60.00 $ 128.00 $ 205.00 $ $ 185.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 5.0 2 0 1 3 3 0 3
GROUP 6.0 HIGH SCHOOL
1|Season Passes (Adult) 2 _C $ 56.00 | $ 56.00 | $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 21.00 | $ 21.001 $ 20.00 | $ 40.00 | $ - $ $ 45.00 | $ 45.00
2|Season Passes (Student) 2 C $ 56.00 | $ 56.00 | $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 21.00 | $ 21.00]1$ 20.00 | $ 40.00 | $ - $ $ 45.00 | $ 45.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 6.0 $ 112.00 $ - $ - $ 42.00 $ 80.00 $ $ 90.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 6.0 2 o] o] 2 2 0 2




PURCHASING DIVISION
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

CITY OF OCEAN CITY

AMERICA'S GREATEST FAMILY RESORT

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesaday, Janaury 8, 2013

CITY CONTRACT #: 13-04

PROPOSAL NAME: Printing Services for the City of Ocean City &
The Ocean City Board of Education

NAME, ADDRESS AND AK Printing Inc. Allegra #387 (DBA) Copiers Plus, Inc. Del Val Print Solutions Express Press (DBA) GraphiColor Corporation Howe's Standard Publishing
BID OF EACH BIDDER 191 Throckmorton Street SJ Shore Marketing, LLC 3112 Fire Road 27 Chestertown Road Allegro Printing Corporation 3490 North Mill Road 1980 South West Boulevard
Freehold, NJ 07728 510 South Shore Road Egg Harbor Twonship, NJ 08234 |Erial, NJ 08081 623 Tilton Road Vineland, NJ 08360 Vineland, NJ 08360
Marmora, NJ 08223 Northfield, NJ 08225
Adam Kleinwaks, President Nicholas J. Wieand, Owner/Operator Robert P. Matthews, President Joseph Hughes, Jr. Richard H. Lamkin, President Robert W. Stenger, Jr., President Barry Opromollo, President
Ph: (723) 333-0031 Ph: (609) 390-1400 Ph: (609) 645-7587 Ph: (856) 344-2249 Ph: (609) 641-7060 Ph: (856) 691-2507 Ph: (856) 691-2000
Fx: (732) 333-0064 Fx: (609) 390-0217 Fx: (609) 645-1535 Fx: n/a Fx: (609) 383-0340 Fx: (856) 696-3229 Fx: (856-692-4399
email: akprinting@comcast.net email: nickw@allegramarmora.com email:_infor @ copiersplus.com email: dvprint@comcast.net email: expresspress@comcast.net email: graphemail@aol.com email: barry@standard-publishing.com
NO-BID NO-BID
1TEM | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
GROUP 7.0 HIGH SCHOOL GUIDANCE OFFICE
1]|Ocean City High School Profile 3 M $ 444.00 | $ 444.00 | $ - $ - $ 589.00 | $ 589.00 | $ 208.00 | $ 208.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 375.00 | $ - $ - $ 61.67 | $ 185.00
2|Schedule Change Forms 1 M $ 70.00 [ $ 70.00]1$ - $ - $ 130.00 | $ 130.00] $ 70.00 [ $ 70.00] % 115.00 | $ 115.00] $ - $ - $ 80.00 | $ 80.00
3|Academic Progress Report 1 M $ 70.00 [ $ 70.00] $ - $ - $ 130.00 | $ 130.00 | $ 70.00 [ $ 70.00}) $ 115.00 | $ 115.00 | $ - $ - $ 80.00 | $ 80.00
4|Student Folders 5 C $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 87.00 [ $ 87.00] $ 44.00 [ $ 220.00 | $ - $ - $ 115.00 | $ 115.00
5]OCHS Program of Studies Booklet 15 M $ 2,954.00 | $ 2,954.00 | $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 4,651.00 | $ 4,651.00| $ 1,016.66 | $ 1,525.00 | $ - $ - $ 1,960.00 | $ 2,940.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 7.0 $ 3,538.00 $ - $ 849.00 $ 5,086.00 $ 2,350.00 $ - $ 3,400.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 7.0 4 0 3 5 5 0 5
GROUP 8.0 ENVELOPES
1]#10 Envelopes with Return Address 5 C $ 29.00 [ $ 29.00]1$ - $ - $ - $ - $ 4400 $ 44.00]1 $ 46.00 [ $ 46.00 | $ - $ - $ 44.00 [ $ 44.00
1 M $ 52.00 [ $ 52.00 | $ - $ - $ 89.00 [ $ 89.00} $ 55.00 [ $ 55.00 | $ 52.00 [ $ 52.00 ) $ - $ - $ 60.00 | $ 60.00
3 M $ 132.00 | $ 132.00] $ - $ - $ 179.00 | $ 179.00| $ 112.00 | $ 112.00] $ 45.00 [ $ 135.00] $ - $ - $ 3500 $ 105.00
5 M $ 200.00 | $ 200.00 | $ - $ - $ 249.00 | $ 249.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 160.00 | $ 42.00 [ $ 210.00 | $ - $ - $ 40.00 | $ 200.00
10 M $ 360.00 | $ 360.00 ] $ - $ - $ 399.00 | $ 399.00] $ 285.00 [ $ 285.00] $ 40.00 [ $ 400.00 | $ - $ - $ 3550 | $ 355.00
2|Report Card Envelopes 5 C $ 104.00 | $ 104.00] $ - - - $ - $ 145.00 | $ 145.00 15.00 | $ 75.00 - $ - $ 50.00 50.00
1 M $ 157.00 | $ 157.00 | $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 191.00 | $ 191.00 | $ 85.00 [ $ 85.00] $ - $ - $ 70.00 | $ 70.00
3|#10 Window Envelopes 5 C $ 29.00 [ $ 29.00] $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 48.00 [ $ 48.00 | $ 46.00 [ $ 46.00 | $ - $ - $ 45.00 | $ 45.00
1 M $ 52.00 [ $ 52.00]1$ - $ - $ 99.00 | $ 99.00] $ 59.00 [ $ 59.00] $ 52.00 [ $ 52.00] $ - $ - $ 60.00 | $ 60.00
3 M $ 132.00 | $ 132.00 | $ - $ - $ 199.00 | $ 199.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 125.00 | $ 45.00 [ $ 135.00 | $ - $ - $ 40.00 | $ 120.00
5 M $ 200.00 [ $ 200.00]1$ - $ - $ 269.00 | $ 269.00| $ 185.00 | $ 185.00| $ 42.00 [ $ 210.00] $ - $ - $ 42.00 [ $ 210.00
10 M $ 360.00 | $ 360.00 | $ - $ - $ 419.00 | $ 419.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 40.00 [ $ 400.00 | $ - $ - $ 38.50 | $ 385.00
4|White Peel & Stick Catalog Envelopes 5 C $ 166.00 | $ 166.00 | $ - $ - $ 199.00 | $ 199.00 | $ 95.00 [ $ 95.00 ) $ 25.00 [ $ 125.00 | $ - $ - $ 110.00 | $ 110.00
1 M $ 273.00 [ $ 273.00]1 $ - - $ 229.00 | $ 229.00] $ 160.00 | $ 160.00| $ 195.00 | $ 195.00 - $ - $ 175.00 175.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 8.0 $ 2,246.00 $ - $ 2,330.00 $ 1,994.00 $ 2,166.00 $ - $ 1,989.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 8.0 14 0 10 4 4 0 14




PURCHASING DIVISION
SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

CITY OF OCEAN CITY

AMERICA'S GREATEST FAMILY RESORT

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesaday, Janaury 8, 2013

CITY CONTRACT #: 13-04

PROPOSAL NAME: Printing Services for the City of Ocean City &
The Ocean City Board of Education

NAME, ADDRESS AND AK Printing Inc. Allegra #387 (DBA) Copiers Plus, Inc. Del Val Print Solutions Express Press (DBA) GraphiColor Corporation Howe's Standard Publishing
BID OF EACH BIDDER 191 Throckmorton Street SJ Shore Marketing, LLC 3112 Fire Road 27 Chestertown Road Allegro Printing Corporation 3490 North Mill Road 1980 South West Boulevard
Freehold, NJ 07728 510 South Shore Road Egg Harbor Twonship, NJ 08234 |Erial, NJ 08081 623 Tilton Road Vineland, NJ 08360 Vineland, NJ 08360
Marmora, NJ 08223 Northfield, NJ 08225
Adam Kleinwaks, President Nicholas J. Wieand, Owner/Operator Robert P. Matthews, President Joseph Hughes, Jr. Richard H. Lamkin, President Robert W. Stenger, Jr., President Barry Opromollo, President
Ph: (723) 333-0031 Ph: (609) 390-1400 Ph: (609) 645-7587 Ph: (856) 344-2249 Ph: (609) 641-7060 Ph: (856) 691-2507 Ph: (856) 691-2000
Fx: (732) 333-0064 Fx: (609) 390-0217 Fx: (609) 645-1535 Fx: n/a Fx: (609) 383-0340 Fx: (856) 696-3229 Fx: (856-692-4399
email: akprinting@comcast.net email: nickw@allegramarmora.com email:_infor @ copiersplus.com email: dvprint@comcast.net email: expresspress@comcast.net email: graphemail@aol.com email: barry@standard-publishing.com
NO-BID NO-BID
1TEM | DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
GROUP 9.0-LETTERHEAD/MEMO PAPER
1|Standardized Letterhead 5 C $ 43.00 | $ 43.00] $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 58.00 [ $ 58.00 | $ 9.00 | $ 45.00 | $ - $ - $ 40.00 | $ 40.00
1 M $ 79.00 [ $ 79.00]1$ - $ - $ - $ - $ 78.00 [ $ 78.00] % 58.00 [ $ 58.00] $ - $ - $ 50.00 | $ 50.00
25 M $ 17750 | $ 17750 | $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 150.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 49.00 [ $ 122.50 | $ - $ - $ 36.00 | $ 90.00
3 M $ 207.00 | $ 207.00 | $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 175.00 | $ 175.00 | $ 48.00 [ $ 144.00 | $ - $ - $ 35.00 | $ 105.00
5 M $ 320.00 [ $ 320.00]1$ - $ - $ - $ - $ 221.00 | $ 221.00] $ 45.00 [ $ 225.00] $ - $ - $ 32.00|$ 160.00
2|Standardized Memo Sheets 10 PADS | $ 36.00 [ $ 36.00]$ - $ - $ 55.00 | $ 55.00] $ 45.00 [ $ 45.00 ] $ 530 | $ 53.00] $ - $ - $ 35.00|$ 35.00
(100 sheets/pad) 20 PADS | $ 55.00 [ $ 55.00 | $ - $ - $ 110.00 | $ 110.00 | $ 53.00 [ $ 53.00 ) $ 375 $ 75.00 ) $ - $ - $ 20.00 | $ 50.00
3|Bond Paper to Match Standardized Letterhead 5 C $ 43.00 | $ 43.00] $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 58.00 [ $ 58.00 | $ 5.60 | $ 28.00) $ - $ - $ 15.00 | $ 15.00
1 M $ 79.00 [ $ 79.00]1$ - $ - $ - $ - $ 78.00 [ $ 78.00] % 48.00 [ $ 48.00 ] $ - $ - $ 2500 | $ 25.00
4|Copy Alert Security Paper 25 M $ 188.75 | $ 188.75] $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 86.00 [ $ 215.00] $ - $ - $ 130.00 | $ 325.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 9.0 $ 1,228.25 $ - $ 165.00 $ 916.00 $ 1,013.50 $ - $ 895.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 9.0 10 0 2 3 4 0 10
GROUP 10.0-BUSINESS CARDS
1|Standardized Business Cards 1 ¢C $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 68.00 | $ 68.00] $ 65.00 [ $ 65.00] % 11.20 | $ 56.00] $ - $ - $ 75.00 | $ 75.00
1 M $ - $ - $ - $ - $ 78.00 | $ 78.00 ] $ 85.00 [ $ 85.00 ] $ 66.00 | $ 66.00 | $ - $ - $ 80.00 | $ 80.00
TOTAL AMOUNT OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 10.0 $ - $ - $ 146.00 $ 150.00 $ 122.00 $ - $ 155.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 10.0 0 0 2 1 1 0 2
TOTAL DOLLAR AMOUNT OF ALL ITEMS/GROUPS BID $ 3,474.25 $ - $ 5,034.00 $ 8,958.00 $ 9,103.00 $ - $ 14,766.00
TOTAL NUMBER OF GROUPS BID 8 0 8 10 10 [o] 10
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID 24 o] 23 33 34 [0] 56
Required Information
RIGHT TO EXTEND-TIME FOR AWARD: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE STATEMENT: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
NJ MANDATORY EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY LANGUAGE: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
NJ AFFIRMATIVE ACTION COMPLIANCE NOTICE: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF RECEIPT OF ADDENDA: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y
NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE (BRC) SUBMITTED : YES/NO N YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y




