
CITY OF OCEAN CITY
AMERICA’S GREATEST FAMILY RESORT

PURCHASING DIVISION DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, October 23, 2012 @ 2:00 PM, EDT
SUMMARY OF BIDS CITY CONTRACT #: 13-01

PROPOSAL NAME: Firework Shows for the Calendar Years 2013 & 2014
for the City of Ocean City & the Ocean City Business

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ Neighborhood Development
NAME, ADDRESS AND Pyrotecnico Zambelli Fireworks
BID OF EACH BIDDER P. O. Box 149 P. O. Box 1463

New Castle, PA  16103 New Castle, PA  16103

KEY Ken Furstoss, Show Producer Kimberly E. Ceyrolles, Sales, Project Mgr.
Apparent Low Bidder

Ph:  (856) 697-1023 Ph:  (800) 245-0397
Fx:  9856) 697-9557 Fx:  n/a
email:  kfurstoss@pyrotecnico.com email:  kceyrolles@sambellifireworks.com

ITEM DESCRIPTION
TOTAL AMOUNT FOR THE 

SHOW
TOTAL AMOUNT FOR THE 

SHOW
TOTAL AMOUNT FOR 

THE SHOW
TOTAL AMOUNT FOR 

THE SHOW
TOTAL AMOUNT FOR 

THE SHOW
BASE BID-CITY OF OCEAN CITY
1.  CALENDAR YEAR 2013-FOURTH OF JULY FIREWORKS SHOW

1 a BASE RATE FOR THE FIREWORKS SHOW AS SPECIFIED 48 000 00$ no bid -$ -$ -$1.a BASE RATE FOR THE FIREWORKS SHOW AS SPECIFIED 48,000.00$                           no bid $                          $                           $                           
Scheduled Show Date/Time:  Thursday, July 4, 2013 @ 9:30 PM-9:45 
PM EDT

1.b RATE FOR WEATHER/RAIN DELAY POSTPONEMENT 6,600.00$                             no bid -$                          -$                           -$                           

TOTAL OF ITEMS 1.a & 1.b 54,600.00$                   no bid -$                   -$                    -$                    

1.c OPTIONAL ITEM-AD-ON EXTRA GRANDE FINALE 
PRESENTATION SHELLS 5,000.00$                              no bid -$                           -$                           -$                           

2.  CALENDAR YEAR 2014-FOURTH OF JULY FIREWORKS SHOW

2.a BASE RATE FOR THE FIREWORKS SHOW AS SPECIFIED 48,000.00$                           no bid -$                          -$                           -$                           
Scheduled Show Date/Time:  Friday, July 4, 2014 @ 9:30 PM-9:45 
PM EDT

2.b RATE FOR WEATHER/RAIN DELAY POSTPONEMENT 6,600.00$                             no bid -$                          -$                           -$                           

TOTAL OF ITEMS 2.a & 2.b 54,600.00$                   no bid -$                   -$                    -$                    

2.c OPTIONAL ITEM-ADD-ON EXTRA GRANDE FINALE 
PRESENTATION SHELLS 5,000.00$                              no bid -$                           -$                           -$                           

BASE BID - B.A.N.D

1.  CALENDAR YEAR 2013 INDIAN SUMMER WEEKEND FIREWORKS SHOW

1.a BASE RATE FOR THE FIREWORKS SHOW AS SPECIFIED 48,000.00$                           no bid -$                          -$                           -$                           
Scheduled Show Date/Time:  Saturday, October 12, 2013 @ 9:30 PM-
9:45 PM EDT

1.b RATE FOR WEATHER/RAIN DELAY POSTPONEMENT 6,600.00$                             no bid -$                          -$                           -$                           

TOTAL OF ITEMS 1.a & 2.b 54,600.00$                   no bid -$                   -$                    -$                    

1.c OPTIONAL ITEM-ADD-ON EXTRA GRANDE FINALE 
PRESENTATION SHELLS 5,000.00$                              no bid -$                           -$                           -$                           



PURCHASING DIVISION DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, October 23, 2012 @ 2:00 PM, EDT
SUMMARY OF BIDS CITY CONTRACT #: 13-01

PROPOSAL NAME: Firework Shows for the Calendar Years 2013 & 2014
for the City of Ocean City & the Ocean City Business

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ Neighborhood Development
NAME, ADDRESS AND Pyrotecnico Zambelli Fireworks
BID OF EACH BIDDER P. O. Box 149 P. O. Box 1463

New Castle, PA  16103 New Castle, PA  16103

KEY Ken Furstoss, Show Producer Kimberly E. Ceyrolles, Sales, Project Mgr.
Apparent Low Bidder

Ph:  (856) 697-1023 Ph:  (800) 245-0397
Fx:  9856) 697-9557 Fx:  n/a
email:  kfurstoss@pyrotecnico.com email:  kceyrolles@sambellifireworks.com

ITEM DESCRIPTION
TOTAL AMOUNT FOR THE 

SHOW
TOTAL AMOUNT FOR THE 

SHOW
TOTAL AMOUNT FOR 

THE SHOW
TOTAL AMOUNT FOR 

THE SHOW
TOTAL AMOUNT FOR 

THE SHOW

2.  CALENDAR YEAR 2014-INDIAN SUMMER WEEKEND FIREWORKS SHOW

2.a BASE RATE FOR THE FIREWORKS SHOW AS SPECIFIED 48,000.00$                           no bid -$                          -$                           -$                           
Scheduled Show Date/Time:  Saturday, October 11, 2014 @ 9:30 PM-
9:45 PM EDT

2.b RATE FOR WEATHER/RAIN DELAY POSTPONEMENT 6,600.00$                             no bid -$                          -$                           -$                           

TOTAL OF ITEMS 2.a & 2.b 54,600.00$                   no bid -$                   -$                    -$                    

2.c OPTIONAL ITEM-ADD-ON EXTRA GRANDE FINALE 
PRESENTATION SHELLS 5,000.00$                              no bid -$                           -$                           -$                           

Required Information
BID DEPOSIT: YES/NO Y YES/NO N/A YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO

CERTIFICATE OF SURETY: YES/NO Y (letter of intent) YES/NO N/A YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO

RIGHT TO EXTEND-TIME FOR AWARD: YES/NO Y YES/NO N/A YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO

STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE STATE: YES/NO Y YES/NO N/A YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT: YES/NO Y YES/NO N/A YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO

MANDATORY EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY LANGUAGE: YES/NO Y YES/NO N/A YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO

NEW JERSEY AFFIRMATIVE ACTION COMPLIANCE NOTICE: YES/NO Y YES/NO N/A YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF RECEIPT OF ADDENDA/CLARIFICATION (1): YES/NO Y YES/NO N/A YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO

NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE (BRC) SUBMITTED: YES/NO Y YES/NO N/A YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO

GENERAL CONTRACT INFORMATION: YES/NO Y YES/NO N/A YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO

LIST OF REFERENCES: YES/NO Y YES/NO N/A YES/NO YES/NO YES/NO

NUMBER OF COPIES SUBMITTED (3): 3 N/A


