
   CITY OF OCEAN CITY
AMERICA’S GREATEST FAMILY RESORT

PURCHASING DIVISION
SUMMARY OF BIDS DATE RECEIVED: Friday, January 18, 2013 @ 2:00 pm

CITY CONTRACT #: 12-68 R-1
BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ PROPOSAL NAME: FEMA STEP Program-Emergency Protective Measures &

City Building Restoration Required Due to Super Storm Sandy
NAME, ADDRESS & Bayside Construction Services, LLC Capri Construction Co., Inc. L.R. Costanzo Company, Inc. Ocean Construction LLC Plymouth Environmental Co., Inc. Tri-County Real Estate Maintenance Co.

BID OF EACH BIDDER 1903 Glenwood Drive 4266 Post Road 1111 Long Beach Boulevard 21 E. Devonshire Avenue 9236 Haws Avenue 189 Delaware Avenue
Ocean City, NJ  08226 Vineland, NJ  08360 Surf City, NJ  08008 Linwood, NJ  08221 Norristown, PA  19401 Carneys Point, NJ  08069

Glenn Watson, Managing Partner Lisa M. Capriotti, Secretary/Treasurer Louis E. Costanzo, Vice President Joseph Rodriguez, President James Kelly, President John Bibeau, President

Ph:  (609) 377-6543 Ph:  (856) 692-4767 Ph:  (609) 488-6015 Ph:  (609) 653-0133 Ph:  (610) 239-9920 Ph:  (856) 299-6290
Fx:  n/a Fx:  (856) 696-3624 Fx:  (609) 488-6015 Fx:  (609) 840-6071 Fx:  (610) 239-9921 Fx:  856) 299-7672
email:  OCBaysideLLC@Gmail.com email:  capco@comast.net email:  L.Costanzo@lrcostanzo.com email:  joer@oceanconst.com email:  jkelly@pllyenv.com email:  jbibeautcpcontrol.com

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT PERCENT
PART 1-FEMA STEP Pilot Program

1

Overhead & Profit over the total cost to 
complete the required work at each designated 
site 1 Percent 15% 41.00% 7.00% 20% 25% 15%

PART 11-City Building Restorations TOTAL COST-LUMP SUM TOTAL COST-LUMP SUM TOTAL COST-LUMP SUM TOTAL COST-LUMP SUM TOTAL COST-LUMP SUM TOTAL COST-LUMP SUM
1 Building #1-Spadfora's Restaurant & Clam Bar 1 LS 8,800.00$                          4,037.00$                         no-bid 55,800.00$                        7,200.00$                        18,000.00$                      

2 Building #2-Bayside Center Pool House 1 LS 19,995.00$                        14,198.00$                        no-bid 55,500.00$                        17,600.00$                      21,000.00$                      
3 Building # 3-Golf Pro Shop 1 LS 11,200.00$                        7,211.00$                         no-bid 34,200.00$                        8,060.00$                        18,000.00$                      
4 Building #4-46th Street Post Office 1 LS 17,950.00$                        14,366.00$                        no-bid 18,350.00$                        14,280.00$                      19,900.00$                      

5 Building #5-46th Street Beach Tag Office 1 LS 16 250 00$ 8 918 00$ no-bid 6 900 00$ 11 800 00$ 16 600 00$5 Building #5-46th Street Beach Tag Office 1 LS 16,250.00$                       8,918.00$                         no-bid 6,900.00$                         11,800.00$                      16,600.00$                      

6

Buildings #6-Beach Patrol headquarters-1st 
Street & the Boardwalk, 34th Street & the 
Beach & 58th Street & the Beach-Beach Patrol 
Stations 1 LS 8,600.00$                          8,000.00$                         no-bid 7,700.00$                          7,400.00$                        7,200.00$                        

74,195.00$                        48,730.00$                        170,750.00$                      58,940.00$                      93,500.00$                      
REQUIRED INFORMATION

DAVIS BACON REQUIREMENTS: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

COPELAND "ANTI-KICKBACK" ACT CERTIFICATION: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

BUY AMERICAN CERTIFICATION: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

LOBBYING CERTIFICATION: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

ESBE PARTICIPATION: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

FORM B-AFFIDAVIT OF DBE STATUS: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

RIGHT TO EXTEND-TIME FOR AWARD: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

 STOCKHOLDER DISCLOSURE STATEMENT: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

NJ MANDATORY EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY LANGUAGE: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

NJ AFFIRMATIVE ACTION REGULATION COMPLIANCE NOTICE: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

REQUIRED SUB-CONTRACTORS LISTING: YES/NO Y (2) YES/NO Y (4) YES/NO Y (8) YES/NO Y (1) YES/NO Y YES/NO Y (2)

OTHER SUBCONTRACTORS LISTED: YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO N/A YES/NO Y (10) YES/NO N/A

ACKNOWLEDGMENT OF RECEIPT OF ADDENDA & CLARIFICATIONS: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE (BRC) SUBMITTED: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

NJ BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE SUB CONTRACTORS (BRC) SUBMITTED: YES/NO N YES/NO Y (4) YES/NO N YES/NO N YES/NO N YES/NO N

NJ PUBLIC WORKS CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION ACT CERTIFICATE: YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y YES/NO Y

NJ PUBLIC WORKS CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION ACT CERTIFICATE FOR
SUB CONTRACTORS: YES/NO N YES/NO Y (4) YES/NO N YES/NO N YES/NO N YES/NO N

NUMBER OF COPIES REQUIRED (3): 3 3 3 3 3 3


