SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

CITY OF OCEAN CITY

AMERICA’'S GREATEST FAMILY RESORT

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, September 18, 2012 @ 2:00 PM, EDT

CITY CONTRACT NO: 12-10
CONTRACT NAME: SUPPLY & DELIVERY OF LUMBER AND PILING

NAME, ADDRESS AND
BID OF EACH BIDDER

KEY
Awarded as per 40A:11-18 -American goods & products
to beused whenever possible

Unit Price Bid - Commodity

Diamond M Lumber Co.

Dockside Marine Supply Company

Lumberman Associates, Inc.

Shoemaker Lumber Co., Inc.

U. S. Lumber, Inc.

1883 Route 38

455A North Main Street

P. 0. Box 720

1200 West Avenue

668 S. Evergreen Avenue

Southampton, NJ 08088

Barnegat, NJ 08005

Bristol, PA 19007

Ocean City, NJ 08226

Woodbury Hights, NJ 08097

Arthur S. Mach, President

Mark Hopkins, Regional Sales Manager

Tom Coleman, Vice President

Richard C. Young, President

Isabelita M. Abele, President &

CEO

Ph: (609) 261-2701

Ph: (609) 660-9300

Ph: (215) 785-4600

Ph: (609) 399-0150

Ph: (856) 853-1770

Fx: (609) 261-2749

Fx: (609) 660-7797

Fx: (215) 785-5645

Fx: (609) 399-1043

Fx: (856) 384-8351

email: n/a

email: markh@docksidemarinesupply.com

email: tomc@lumbermanassoc.com

email: shoemaker@comcast.net

email: info@uslumberinc.com

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY

UNIT COST

TOTAL COST

UNIT COST TOTAL COST

UNIT COST

TOTAL COST

UNIT COST TOTAL COST

UNIT COST TOTAL COST

GROUP A - 5/4" SOUTHERN YELLOW PINE

[

5/4"x 6"x 8', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, E4E, MCA above ground contact, Type C,

Grade Premium

0- 1,440

PCS

7,804.80

6.09

8,769.60

5.30

7,632.00

$ 7,603.20

7,416.00

5/4"x 6"x12', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, E4E,MCA above ground contact, Type C,

Grade Premium

0- 480

PCS

3,580.80

8.34

4,003.20

7.20

3,456.00

$ 3,456.00

3,542.40

GROUP A TOTAL AMOUNT

11,385.60

12,772.80

11,088.00

$ 11,059.20

10,958.40

TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID

2

2

2

2

2

GROUP B - 1" SOUTHERN YELLOW PINE

NOT REQUIRED AT THIS TIME

GROUP C - 2" SOUTHERN YELLOW PINE

[

2"x4"x16', Southern Yellow Pine,

S48, E4E, ACQ 0.25, Type C,

Grade #1

0- 100

PCS

728.00

7.97

797.00

6.40

640.00

no-bid

no-bid

2"x6"x10', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, E4E, MCA above ground contact, Type C,

2.1A - Southern pine, SP1B Table 1.B

select structural only, S4S,E4E with fiber

bending rating of 2550 psi. All lumber

shall be K.D.A.T or A.D.A.T. to achieve

in-service moisture content of 19% after

treatment. Heartwood shall be less than 10%

0- 1,280

PCS

10,496.00

8.58

10,982.40

5.60

7,168.00

no-bid

no-bid




SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, September 18, 2012 @ 2:00 PM, EDT

CITY CONTRACT NO: 12-10

CONTRACT NAME: SUPPLY & DELIVERY OF LUMBER AND PILING

KEY

NAME, ADDRESS AND
BID OF EACH BIDDER

Awarded as per 40A:11-18 -American goods & products

to beused whenever possible

Unit Price Bid - Commodity

Diamond M Lumber Co.

Dockside Marine Supply Company

Lumberman Associates, Inc.

Shoemaker Lumber Co., Inc.

U. S. Lumber, Inc.

1883 Route 38

455A North Main Street

P. 0. Box 720

1200 West Avenue

668 S. Evergreen Avenue

Southampton, NJ 08088

Barnegat, NJ 08005

Bristol, PA 19007

Ocean City, NJ 08226

Woodbury Hights, NJ 08097

Arthur S. Mach, President

Mark Hopkins, Regional Sales Manager

Tom Coleman, Vice President

Richard C. Young, President

Isabelita M. Abele, President &

CEO

Ph: (609) 261-2701

Ph: (609) 660-9300

Ph: (215) 785-4600

Ph: (609) 399-0150

Ph: (856) 853-1770

Fx: (609) 261-2749

Fx: (609) 660-7797

Fx: (215) 785-5645

Fx: (609) 399-1043

Fx: (856) 384-8351

email: n/a

email: markh@docksidemarinesupply.com

email: tomc@lumbermanassoc.com

email: shoemaker@comcast.net

email: info@Quslumberinc.com

ITEM

DESCRIPTION

QTY

UNIT COST TOTAL COST

UNIT COST TOTAL COST

UNIT COST TOTAL COST

UNIT COST TOTAL COST

UNIT COST

TOTAL COST

w

2"x6"x12', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, E4E, MCA above ground contact, Type C,

2.1A - Southern pine, SP1B Table 1.B

select structural only, S4S,E4E with fiber

bending rating of 2550 psi. All lumber

shall be K.D.A.T or A.D.A.T. to achieve

in-service moisture content of 19% after

Treatment. Heartwood shall be less than 10%

640- 5,000

PCS

9.96

$ 49,800.00

$ 10.53

52,650.00

35,000.00

no-bid

no-bid

N

2"x6"x16', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, E4E, MCA above ground contact, Type C,

2.1A - Southern pine, SP1B Table 1.B

select structural only, S4S,E4E with fiber

bending rating of 2550 psi. All lumber

shall be K.D.A.T or A.D.A.T. to achieve

in-service moisture content of 19% after

treatment. Heartwood shall be less than 10%

128- 2,560

PCS

13.28

$ 33,996.80

$ 14.56

37,273.60

24,832.00

no-bid

no-bid

ul

2"x6"x20', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, E4E, MCA above ground contact, Type C,

2.1A - Southern pine, SP1B Table 1.B

select structural only, S4S,E4E with fiber

bending rating of 2550 psi. All lumber

shall be K.D.A.T or A.D.A.T. to achieve

in-service moisture content of 19% after

treatment. Heartwood shall be less than 10%

0- 2,560

PCS

18.40

$ 47,104.00

$ 20.93

53,580.80

$ 14.50

37,120.00

no-bid

no-bid

GROUP C TOTAL AMOUNT

$ 142,124.80

155,283.80

104,760.00

TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP C

5

5

5




SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, September 18, 2012 @ 2:00 PM, EDT
CITY CONTRACT NO: 12-10
CONTRACT NAME: SUPPLY & DELIVERY OF LUMBER AND PILING

KEY

NAME, ADDRESS AND
BID OF EACH BIDDER

Awarded as per 40A:11-18 -American goods & products
to beused whenever possible

Unit Price Bid - Commodity

Diamond M Lumber Co.

Dockside Marine Supply Company

Lumberman Associates, Inc.

Shoemaker Lumber Co., Inc.

U. S. Lumber, Inc.

1883 Route 38

455A North Main Street

P. 0. Box 720

1200 West Avenue

668 S. Evergreen Avenue

Southampton, NJ 08088

Barnegat, NJ 08005

Bristol, PA 19007

Ocean City, NJ 08226

Woodbury Hights, NJ 08097

Arthur S. Mach, President

Mark Hopkins, Regional Sales Manager

Tom Coleman, Vice President

Richard C. Young, President

Isabelita M. Abele, President &

CEO

Ph: (609) 261-2701

Ph: (609) 660-9300

Ph: (215) 785-4600

Ph: (609) 399-0150

Ph: (856) 853-1770

Fx: (609) 261-2749

Fx: (609) 660-7797

Fx: (215) 785-5645

Fx: (609) 399-1043

Fx: (856) 384-8351

email: n/a

email: markh@docksidemarinesupply.com

email: tomc@lumbermanassoc.com

email: shoemaker@comcast.net

email: info@Quslumberinc.com

ITEM

DESCRIPTION QTY

UNIT COST TOTAL COST

UNIT COST TOTAL COST

UNIT COST

TOTAL COST

UNIT COST TOTAL COST

UNIT COST TOTAL COST

GROUP D - 3" SOUTHERN YELLOW PINE

[

3"x4"x10', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, MCA ground contact,

2.1A - Southern pine, SP1B Table 1.B

select structural only, S4S,E4E with fiber

bending rating of 2550 psi. All lumber

shall be K.D.A.T or A.D.A.T. to achieve

in-service moisture content of 19% after

treatment. Heartwood shall be less than 10% 0- 500

PCS

$ 1150 [ $ 5,750.00

$ 1463 | $ 7,315.00

$ 12.00 | $

6,000.00

no bid

$ 1715 | $ 8,575.00

N

3"x4"x12', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, MCA ground contact,

2.1A - Southern pine, SP1B Table 1.B

select structural only, S4S,E4E with fiber

bending rating of 2550 psi. All lumber

shall be K.D.A.T or A.D.A.T. to achieve

in-service moisture content of 19% after

treatment. Heartwood shall be less than 10% 0- 500

PCS

$ 1356 | $ 6,780.00

$ 1755 | $ 8,775.00

$ 1440 | $

7,200.00

no-bid

$ 2098 [ $ 10,490.00

w

3"x10"x14', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, Micro ground contact, Type C, Grade #2 0- 100

PCS

$ 36.05[ $ 3,605.00

$ 3891 (% 3,891.00

$ 3250 [ $

3,250.00

$ 31.78 [ $ 3,178.00

$ 45.08 | $ 4,508.00

N

3"x12"x12', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, MCA ground contact, Type C, Grade #2

PCS

$ 37.08 | $ 1,854.00

$ 4095 | $ 2,047.50

$ 34.00 [ $

1,700.00

$ 3252 | $ 1,626.00

$ 4535 | $ 2,267.50

a1

3"x12"x16', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, MCA ground contact, Type C, Grade #2

PCS

$ 4944 1 $ 1,236.00

$ 5460 [ $ 1,365.00

$ 4550 | $

1,137.50

$ 4336 | $ 1,084.00

$ 61.85 [ $ 1,546.25

(=2}

3"x12"x20', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, MCA ground contact, Type C, Grade #2

PCS

$ 6780 [ $ 1,695.00

$ 76.05 [ $ 1,901.25

$ 60.35 [ $

1,508.75

$ 58.60 | $ 1,465.00

$ 89.36 [ $ 2,234.00

3"x12"x24', Southern Yellow Pine,

S4S, MCA ground contact, Type C, Grade #2

PCS

$ 101.16 [ $ 2,529.00

$ 105.30 | $ 2,632.50

$ 87.70 [ $

2,192.50

$ 91.20 [ $ 2,280.00

$ 126.27 | $ 3,156.75

GROUP D TOTAL AMOUNT

$ 23,449.00

$ 27,927.25

$ 22,988.75

$ 9,633.00

$ 32,777.50

TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP D 7

7

7

7

5

7




SUMMARY OF BIDS

BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF OCEAN CITY, NJ

DATE RECEIVED: Tuesday, September 18, 2012 @ 2:00 PM, EDT
CITY CONTRACT NO: 12-10
CONTRACT NAME: SUPPLY & DELIVERY OF LUMBER AND PILING

NAME, ADDRESS AND Diamond M Lumber Co. Dockside Marine Supply Company Lumberman Associates, Inc. Shoemaker Lumber Co., Inc. U. S. Lumber, Inc.
BID OF EACH BIDDER 1883 Route 38 455A North Main Street P. O. Box 720 1200 West Avenue 668 S. Evergreen Avenue
Southampton, NJ 08088 Barnegat, NJ 08005 Bristol, PA 19007 Ocean City, NJ 08226 Woodbury Hights, NJ 08097
KEY Arthur S. Mach, President Mark Hopkins, Regional Sales Manager Tom Coleman, Vice President Richard C. Young, President Isabelita M. Abele, President &
Awarded as per 40A:11-18 -American goods & products CEO
to beused whenever possible Ph: (609) 261-2701 Ph: (609) 660-9300 Ph: (215) 785-4600 Ph: (609) 399-0150 Ph: (856) 853-1770
Fx: (609) 261-2749 Fx: (609) 660-7797 Fx: (215) 785-5645 Fx: (609) 399-1043 Fx: (856) 384-8351
Unit Price Bid - Commodity email: n/a email: markh@docksidemarinesupply.com email: tomc@lumbermanassoc.com Jemail: shoemaker@comcast.net Jemail: info@uslumberinc.com
ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
GROUP E - 4" SOUTHERN YELLOW PINE
NOT REQUIRED AT THIS TIME
GROUP F — 6 " SOUTHERN YELLOW PINE
NOT REQUIRED AT THIS TIME
GROUP G - 2 7/8" SOUTHERN YELLOW PINE
NOT REQUIRED AT THIS TIME
GROUP H - FIR PLYWOOD
1|1/2" x 4' x 8', AC Fir Plywood 0-100 ([pcs |'s$ 30.46 3,046.00 | $ - no -bid | $ - no-bid | $ 3456 | $ 3,456.00 | $ 29.00 | $ 2,900.00
2[3/4" x 4' x 8', AC Fir Plywood 0-100 ([pcs |'s$ 37.28 3,728.00] $ - no-bid | $ - no-bid | $ 42.88 | $ 4,288.00 ] $ 35.05|$ 3,505.00
3|3/4" x 4' x 8', CDX Fir Plywood 0-100 ([pcs |'$ 27.04 2,704.00 | $ - no-bid | $ - no-bid | $ 2887 $ 2,887.00 ] $ 2781 1% 2,781.00
4[1/2" x 4' x 8', CDX, 4 ply, Fir Plywood 0- 200 $ 20.38 4,076.00 - no-bid - no-bid | $ 1984 [ $ 3,968.00 | $ 19.90 [ $ 3,980.00
GROUP H TOTAL AMOUNT $ 13,554.00 - $ - $ 14,599.00 $ 13,166.00
TOTAL ITEMS BID IN GROUP H 4 4 0 4 4
GROUP I - PILING
1|35' Piling, 12" Butt, 8" Tip, 2.5 CCA 0- 20 PCS | $ 305.20 6,104.00 | $ - no -bid | $ 360.50 [ $ 7,210.00 | $ - no-bid | $ - no-bid
240" Piling, 12" Butt, 6" Tip, 2.5 CCA 0- 10 PCS | $ 348.80 3,488.00] $ - no-bid | $ 406.00 | $ 4,060.00 | $ - no-bid | $ - no-bid
3|25' Piling, 12" Butt, 6" Tip ,2.5 CCA 0- 40 PCS | $ 263.50 10,540.00 | $ - no-bid | $ 253.75 [ $ 10,150.00 | $ - no-bid | $ - no-bid
GROUP | TOTAL AMOUNT $ 20,132.00 - $ 21,420.00 $ - $ -
TOTAL NUMBER OF ITEMS BID IN GROUP 1| 3 3 3 0 0
GROUP J - WHITE PINE - VARIOUS SIZES
NOT REQUIRED AT THIS TIME
TOTAL DOLLAR AMOUNT BID IN ALL GROUPS OF THE BASE
BID-GROUPS A-1 210,645.40 195,983.85 $ 160,256.75 $ 35,291.20 $ 56,901.90
TOTAL NUMBER OF ALL ITEMS BID A-I 21 14 17 11 13
Required Information
RIGHT TO EXTEND-TIME FOR AWARD: Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y
STOCKHOLDERS DISCLOSURE STATEMENT: Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT: Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y
MANDATORY EQUAL EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY LANGUAGE: Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y
AFFIRMATIVE ACTION REGULATION COMPLIANCE NOTICE: Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y
ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF RECEIPT OF ADDENDA: Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y
NEW JERSEY BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE (BRC): Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y Y/N Y
CERTIFICATE OF ORIGIN: Y/N Y (USA) Y/N Y (USA) Y/N Y (USA) Y/N Y (USA) Y/N Y (USA)
NUMBER OF COPIES (3): 3 3 3 3 3




